
 

CITY OF DAPHNE 

1705 MAIN STREET, DAPHNE, AL 

CITY COUNCIL BUSINESS MEETING AGENDA 

MONDAY, JUNE 15, 2026 at 6:00 PM  

1. CALL TO ORDER 
 

  A. ROLL CALL 
 

  B. INVOCATION by Reverend Thack Dyson, St. Paul's Episcopal Church 
 

  C. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 

2. PROCLAMATIONS/RECOGNITIONS/PUBLIC HEARINGS 
 

  A. CERTIFICATE OF APPRECIATION to Herb Cole for his service on the Board 

of Zoning Adjustments 
 

  B. PROCLAMATION recognizing Dr. John McMahon, Medical Control Physician, 

for 20 years of service to the citizens of Daphne and the Daphne Fire Rescue 
 

  C. PROCLAMATION recognizing Houston Sanders for his service with the Daphne 

Police Department 
 

  D. PUBLIC HEARING: Ordinance Ratifying, Confirming, and Reaffirming the 

Annexation of Property Contiguous to the Corporate Limits of the City of Daphne - 

Northwest of County Road 64 and Alabama Highway 181 - Joseph A. Allegri Jr 

Properties I, LLC; Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties II, LLC; Jerry and Louise 

Volovecky Sr. Family Limited Partnership 
 

3. APPROVE MINUTES 
 

  A. June 1, 2026, regular meeting 
 

4. REPORTS OF STANDING COMMITTEES 
 

  A. FINANCE COMMITTEE - Conaway 
 

  B. BUILDINGS & PROPERTY COMMITTEE- Messinger 

     Review the May new Construction and Building Report. 

Certificates of Occupancy: 17 

Permits Issued: 178 

New Residential Home Permits: 10 

Total Fees: $66,512.50 
 

  i. Review the minutes from the May 11, 2026, meeting 
 

Page 1 of 135



City Council AGENDA – June 15, 2026 – page 2 

  C. PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE - Green 
 

  i. Review the minutes from the May 11, 2026, meeting 
 

  D. CODE ENFORCEMENT/ORDINANCE COMMITTEE - Roberts 
 

  E. PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE - Coleman 
 

5. REPORTS OF SPECIAL BOARDS & COMMISSIONS 
 

  A. BOARD OF ZONING ADJUSTMENTS - Adrienne Jones 
 

  B. DAPHNE PUBLIC SCHOOL COMMISSION - Messinger 
 

  C. DOWNTOWN REDEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY - Olen 
 

  D. INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT BOARD - Coleman 
 

  E. LIBRARY BOARD - Olen 
 

  F. PLANNING COMMISSION - Olen 
 

  i. Review of the minutes from the regular meeting of April 23, 2026, the report 

of the regular meeting of May 28, 2026, and recommendations. 
 

  G. RECREATION BOARD - Green 
 

  H. UTILITY BOARD - Coleman 
 

  i. Review the minutes from the April 29, 2026, meeting 
 

6. PUBLIC PARTICIPATION 
 

7. MAYOR’S REPORT 
 

8. CITY ATTORNEY REPORT 
 

9. DEPARTMENT HEAD REPORTS 
 

10. CITY CLERK’S REPORT 
 

  A. MOTION to approve the publication and set a public hearing on July 20, 2026 for 

the James A. Conaway and Barbara Conaway Trust dated June 17, 2010 Pre-Zoning 

Amendment located northeast of the intersection of County Road 54 and Centipede 

Drive. 
 

  B. MOTION to approve the publication and set a public hearing on July 20, 2026 for 

the James A. Conaway and Barbara Conaway Trust dated June 17, 2010 Annexation 

Petition located northeast of the intersection of County Road 54 and Centipede 

Drive. 
 

Page 2 of 135



City Council AGENDA – June 15, 2026 – page 3 

  C. MOTION to approve the publication and set a public hearing on July 20, 2026 for 

DAK Investments, LLC Zoning Amendment located at 805 Randall Avenue, 

northeast of the intersection of Randall Avenue and Main Street. 
 

  D. MOTION to approve the Ballin' on Belrose Run/Walk Challenge on May 15, 2027, 

from 6:30am - 1:00pm with a road closure of Belrose Avenue. 
 

11. RESOLUTIONS 
 

12. 2nd READ ORDINANCES 
 

  A. 2026-17 - Zoning District Map - Revisions to the City of Daphne Land Use and 

Development Ordinance 
 

  B. 2026-18 - Ordinance Ratifying, Confirming, and Reaffirming the Annexation of 

Property Contiguous to the Corporate Limits of the City of Daphne — Northwest of 

County Road 64 and Alabama Highway 181 - Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC; 

Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties II, LLC; Jerry and Louise Volovecky Sr. Family 

Limited Partnership 
 

13. 1st READ ORDINANCES 
 

  A. 2026-19 - Ordinance Amending the City of Daphne's Garbage Collection Ordinance 

No. 2017-59, as Codified in Chapter 12, Article III, Daphne Code of Ordinances 
 

  B. 2026-20 - Ordinance Establishing a Temporary Moratorium on the Acceptance and 

Processing of Certain Applications for Multi-Family, Garden Apartment 

Development Pending Comprehensive Revisions to the City's Land Use and 

Development Ordinance 
 

  C. 2026-21 - Ordinance to Repeal Ordinance No. 2019-33 and Adopt the 2024 

International Fire Code with Amendments Thereto for the City of Daphne, Alabama 
 

  D. 2026-22 - Ordinance Amending Ordinance No 2019-25, as Previously Amended by 

Ordinance No. 2021-51, Relating to the Adoption of Certain Technical Codes by 

Reference 
 

14. COUNCIL COMMENTS 
 

15. ADJOURN 
 

 

Page 3 of 135



Page 4 of 135



Page 5 of 135



Page 6 of 135



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE 2026 - 18 

 
ORDINANCE RATIFYING, CONFIRMING, AND REAFFIRMING  

THE ANNEXATION OF PROPERTY CONTIGUOUS TO THE  
CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF DAPHNE 

 
Northwest of County Road 64 and Alabama Highway 181 

Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC; Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties II, LLC; Jerry 
and Louise Volovecky Sr. Family Limited Partnership 

(Confirmation and Ratification of Prior Annexation) 
 

 WHEREAS, on the 18th day of November, 2025, Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties II, LLC, Jerry 
and Louise Volovecky Sr. Family Limited Partnership as the owners of certain real property 
hereinafter described, did file with the City Clerk a petition requesting that said tracts or parcels of 
land be annexed into and become part of the City of Daphne, Alabama (the “City”); and 
 
 WHEREAS, said petition did contain an accurate description of the property to be annexed 
together with a map of the said territory showing its relationship to the corporate limits of the City of 
Daphne, Alabama, and the signatures of the owners of the property described; and 
 

WHEREAS, on April 6, 2026, the City Council considered and adopted Ordinance 2026-08 to 
annex the Property, which was recorded in the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County at 
Instrument Number 2252834; and 
 
 WHEREAS, subsequent to the filing of said petition, an additional record owner of a portion of 
the property, Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC, has executed a Joinder and Ratification of the 
petition for annexation, which is on file with the City Clerk; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that Ordinance 2026-08 effectively annexed the Property 
into the corporate limits of the City and that the Joinder and Ratification executed by Joseph A. 
Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC confirms the consent of all record owners to such annexation; 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council desires to ratify, confirm, and reaffirm the annexation approved 

by Ordinance 2026-08 and to incorporate the Joinder and Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri 
Jr Properties I, LLC into the record of such annexation; and 

 
WHEREAS, after proper publication, a public hearing was held by the City Council on June 15, 

2026, concerning the petition for annexation. 
 
 NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
DAPHNE, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS: 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 7 of 135



2 

 SECTION ONE:   RATIFICATION, CONFIRMATION, AND REAFFIRMATION OF 
    PRIOR ANNEXATION 
 
 The City Council of the City of Daphne finds and declares as the legislative body of the City that 
it is in the best interest of the citizens of the City and the citizens of the affected area to ratify, confirm, 
and reaffirm the annexation of the property described in Section Three, which property was 
previously annexed into the corporate limits of the City pursuant to Ordinance 2026-08.  The Joinder 
and Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC is incorporated herein by 
reference and made a part of the record of this annexation. The City Council hereby ratifies, confirms, 
and reaffirms the annexation approved by Ordinance 2026-08 and finds that the Joinder and 
Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC cures any deficiency arising from the 
omission of that entity from the original petition. 
 

SECTION TWO: ZONING 
 
 At its April 6, 2026 meeting, the City Council adopted Ordinance 2026-07 pre-zoning the property 
described herein as PUD (Planned Unit Development). 
 
 SECTION THREE:  DESCRIPTION OF TERRITORY 
 
 The City Council hereby ratifies and confirms the annexation of the territory described below, 
which territory was previously annexed into the corporate limits of the City pursuant to Ordinance 
2026-08: 

 
Legal Description:  
 

A parcel of land situated in the South one-half of the Southeast one-quarter of Section 
15, Township 5 South, Range 2 East, Baldwin County, Alabama being more particularly 
described as follows: 

BEGIN at a found 1/2 inch rebar marking the Southeast corner of Lot 1-B according 
to the Replat of Lot 1 Volovecky Split Subdivision as recorded in Slide 0003046-C in the 
Office of the Judge of Probate, Baldwin County, Alabama and lying on the West right-of-way 
of State Highway 181; thence leaving said Lot 1-B run South 00 degrees 21 minutes 12 
seconds East along said right-of-way for a distance of 509.93 feet to a found concrete 
monument lying on said right-of-way; thence run South 15 degrees 48 minutes 33 seconds 
East along said right-of-way for a distance of 54.74 feet to a found concrete monument lying 
on said right-of-way; thence leaving said right-of-way run North 88 degrees 54 minutes 29 
seconds West for a distance of 187.99 feet to a found capped rebar stamped Fairhope; thence 
run South 00 degrees 04 minutes 35 seconds West for a distance of 224.97 feet to a found 
capped rebar lying on the North right-of-way of County Road 64; thence run North 89 degrees 
36 minutes 46 seconds West along said right-of-way for a distance of 1396.57 feet to a set 5/8 
inch capped rebar stamped CA-560LS lying on said right-of-way; thence leaving said right-
of-way run North 00 degrees 23 minutes 14 seconds East for a distance of 785.49 feet to a set 
5/8 inch capped rebar stamped CA-560LS lying on the South line of said Lot 1-A of the 
aforementioned subdivision; thence run South 89 degrees 36 minutes 02 seconds East along 
said the South line of said Lot 1-A for a distance of 663.67 feet to a set 5/8 inch capped rebar 
stamped CA-560LS marking a corner on the South line of said Lot 1-A and marking the 

Page 8 of 135



3 

Southwest corner of said Lot 1-B; thence leaving said Lot 1-A continue along the previously 
described call and the South line of said Lot 1-B for a distance of 904.08 feet to the POINT 
OF BEGINNING. Said parcel contains 1,193,213 square feet or 27.39 acres, more or less. 

 
Lot 1-B, Replat of Volovecky Split Subdivision, according to the plat thereof, as 

recorded on Slide 0003046-C in the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County, 
Alabama. 

 
SECTION FOUR:   REFERENCE TO PREVIOUSLY RECORDED   

        ANNEXATION MAP 
 

The map depicting the territory annexed by Ordinance 2026-08 is incorporated herein by 
reference. Said map was attached to and recorded with Ordinance 2026-08 in the Office of the Judge 
of Probate of Baldwin County, Alabama, at Instrument Number 2252834. 

 
SECTION FIVE:    RATIFICATION OF PRIOR ORDINANCE 
 

 Ordinance 2026-08, recorded in the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County, Alabama, 
at Instrument Number 2252834, is hereby ratified, confirmed, and reaffirmed in all respects. The City 
Council finds that the territory described therein was properly annexed into the corporate limits of 
the City and that the Joinder and Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC 
confirms the consent of all record owners to such annexation. Nothing herein shall be construed as 
rescinding, replacing, or nullifying Ordinance 2026-08. 

 
SECTION SIX:    EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

 
 This Ordinance shall become effective upon publication as required by law and shall serve to 
ratify, confirm, and reaffirm the annexation previously approved by Ordinance 2026-08. A certified 
copy of this Ordinance shall be filed with the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County, 
Alabama.  
 
 
 APPROVED AND ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DAPHNE, 
ALABAMA, THIS 15TH DAY OF JUNE, 2026. 
 
 

 
 _________________________________ 
 Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk 

 

Page 9 of 135



June 1, 2026 
CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
6:00 P.M. 

 

Pa
ge

1

 
1. CALL TO ORDER: 

There being a quorum present Council President Benjamin Hughes called the meeting to order at 6:02pm.       

 ROLL CALL: 

COUNCIL MEMBERS PRESENT:  Tommie Conaway, Steve Olen, Joel Coleman, Oliver Roberts, Stephanie 
Messinger, Benjamin Hughes and Jennifer Green 

Also Present: Patrick Dungan, City Attorney; Mayor LeJeune; Chief Gulsby, Police; Chief Tacon, Fire; Troy 
Strunk, City Development; Andy Bobe, City Engineer; Charlie McDavid, Recreation; Bobby Purvis, Public 
Works; Kelli Reid, Finance; Ange Baggett, Marketing; Emmie Powell, Library; Adrienne Jones, Planning; 
Vickie Hinman, Human Resources; and Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk. 

INVOCATION/PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE:   

Invocation was given by Dr. Barry Carpenter, Resurrection Church. 

2. PROCLAMATIONS/RECOGNITIONS/PUBLIC HEARING:   

RECOGNITION:  Chief Tacon recognized and introduced the individuals responsible for decorating the DFD 
fire hydrant. Captain David Saraceno, Apparatus Engineer Thomas Elliot, Firefighter Jason Moore and 
Firefighter Justin Whaley began painting a donated fire hydrant in front of Fire Station #2. The hydrant even has 
its own Instagram page at DFD Holiday Hydrant. 

PUBLIC HEARING:  Adrienne Jones presented the Official City of Daphne Zoning Map Update.  

 Public hearing opened at 6:07pm, with no one present to speak, the public hearing closed at 6:07pm.  

3. APPROVE THE MINUTES:   

The minutes from the May 18, 2026 Regular Meeting were approved.   

4.     REPORT OF STANDING COMMITTEES: 

A.   FINANCE COMMITTEE  
Councilwoman Conaway said the minutes from the May meeting are in the packet and gave the treasurer’s report 
for April 2026:  unrestricted fund balance - $33,262,956; total cash balance - $57,527,042; sales tax for March 
2026 - $2,597,524.66; lodging tax for March 2026 - $196,651.42; debt summary for April 2026:  warrants - 
$26,292,087; capital leases:  general fund - $590,746; enterprise fund - $1,001,938. She said the next meeting is 
June 15th at 4:30pm.  
 
MOTION by Councilwoman Conaway to authorize the Mayor to enter into an agreement with Daupler 

for the Response Management System AI Agenda 24/7. No second was needed. 
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.  

 
B.   BUILDINGS & PROPERTY COMMITTEE  
Councilwoman Messinger said the next meeting is June 8th at 5:15pm.       

 
C.    PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE  
Councilwoman Green said the next meeting is June 8th at 4:30pm.  
 
D.    CODE ENFORCEMENT/ORDINANCE COMMITTEE 
Councilman Roberts said the next meeting is July 6th at 4:30pm and the May 4th minutes are in the packet for 
review. 

Page 10 of 135



June 1, 2026 
CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
6:00 P.M. 

 

Pa
ge

2

 
 
E.    PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE  
Councilman Coleman said the next meeting is July 6th at 5:15pm.   

 

5. REPORTS OF SPECIAL BOARDS & COMMISSIONS: 

      A.    Board of Zoning Adjustments   
Mrs. Jones said there is no meeting in June.  
   
B.     Daphne Public School Commission 
Councilwoman Messinger said the next meeting is August 24th at 5:30pm in the Jubilee Conference Room.  
 
C.    Downtown Redevelopment Authority 
Councilman Olen said the next meeting is June 25th at 5:30pm. 

 
    D.     Industrial Development Board 

Councilman Coleman said the next meeting is June 16th at 4:30pm. 
 

      E.    Library Board 
 Councilman Olen said the next meeting is June 11th at 4:30pm.  
  
      F.    Planning Commission  
 Councilman Olen said the next meeting is June 25th at 5:00pm. 
 

G.    Recreation Board 
 Councilwoman Green said the next meeting is July 15th at 6:00pm.  
 

      H.    Utility Board 
Councilman Coleman said the next meeting is June 24th at 5:00pm 

6. PUBLIC PARTICIPATION:  

Public participation opened at 6:15pm.  

Curt Fonger, 1443 Randall Avenue, shared that the new City website had been launched last week and 
recognized the employees for their hard work. 

Public participation was closed at 6:17pm.   

7. MAYOR’S REPORT:  

Mayor LeJeune recognized the staff who worked on the website and shared some special functions and invited 
everyone to “Coffee with the Mayor” on June 2nd at 9am in the Senior Center.   

8.   CITY ATTORNEY REPORT: 

City Attorney had no report.   
 
 
 
 

Page 11 of 135



June 1, 2026 
CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
6:00 P.M. 

 

Pa
ge

3

 
 

9. DEPARTMENT HEAD COMMENTS: 

Chief Gulsby, Police, shared that three officers are progressing through the Police Academy. He is interviewing 
to fill the Code Enforcement and Corrections positions. Chief Gulsby also recognized his SROs for a recent 
award. 

Ange Baggett, Marketing and Tourism, thanked Kara Wilbourn and Caroline Elliot for their work on the website 
and invited everyone to the American 250 Celebration on June 26th from 4pm-8pm at the Civic Center.  

Emmie Power shared that the Library is getting ready for the Sumer Reading Program and that there will be 60 
programs this month. 

Vickie Hinman, Human Resources, stated that Chase Daniels will be on the Employee Spotlight and that the 
Benefits Fair will be held on August 4th and 5th. 

Bobby Purvis, Public Works, discussed recent rain events and trees down. Public Works was selected as 
Employer of the Year by the Council on Organizations Serving Deaf Alabamians. 

Charlie McDavid, Recreation, shared that there are softball and pickleball tournaments going on and the youth 
football registration is open now. 

Kelli Reid, Finance, shared that it is now budget season.  

10. CITY CLERK’S REPORT:  

MOTION by Councilman Roberts to approve the Special Events Retail to Mancis Antique LLC located 
at 704 Belrose Avenue and authorize the Mayor to execute a Special Events Right of Way Use 

Agreement. Seconded by Councilman Coleman. 
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 

 
MOTION by Councilman Roberts to approve the SEEDS Crawfish for the Classroom on April 3, 2027 

from 4:00pm – 7:00pm on the front law of City Hall located at 1705 Main Street, Daphne, Alabama. 
Seconded by Councilwoman Green. 

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 
 

MOTION by Councilman Roberts to approve the 160 – Special Retain, More than 30 days to American 
Multi Cinema Inc dba Jubilee Square 12 located at 6898 Highway 90, Daphne, Alabama. Seconded by 

Councilman Coleman. 
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 

 

11.  RESOLUTIONS:    

  A. 2026 - 36 - 2026-J-Fourth of July Fireworks Presentation 

  B. 2026 - 37 - Appropriation - Consulting Services for Bayfront Amphitheatre - DM Presents, 
LLC in the amount of $30,000 from the General Fund 

  C. 2026 - 38 - Resolution Declaring Certain Personal Property Surplus and Authorizing the Mayor 
to Dispose of Such Property - PD Evidence Locker to Robertsdale Police Department 

Page 12 of 135



June 1, 2026 
CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
6:00 P.M. 

 

Pa
ge

4

  D. 2026 - 39 - Resolution Declaring Certain Personal Property Surplus and Authorizing the Mayor 
to Dispose of Such Property - 2015 Chevy Tahoe to Creola Police Department 

  E. 2026 - 40 - Resolution Declaring Certain Personal Property Surplus and Authorizing the Mayor 
to Dispose of Such Property - 5 Chevy Tahoes 

   
MOTION by Councilman Coleman to waive the reading of Resolutions 2026-36, 2026-37, 2026-38, 

2026-39 and 2026-40. Seconded by Councilwoman Green.  
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.  

 
MOTION by Councilman Coleman to adopt Resolution 2026-36. Seconded by Councilwoman Green.  

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.  
 

MOTION by Councilman Coleman to adopt Resolution 2026-37. Seconded by Councilwoman Green.  
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 

 
MOTION by Councilman Coleman to adopt Resolution 2026-38. Seconded by Councilman Roberts. 

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 
 

MOTION by Councilman Coleman to adopt Resolution 2026-39. Seconded by Councilwoman 
Conaway. 

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 
 

MOTION by Councilman Coleman to adopt Resolution 2026-40. Seconded by Councilwoman 
Conaway. 

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.   
 
12.  2ND READ ORDINANCES: 

  A. 2026-12 - Ordinance to Amend the Text of the East Fish River PUD Narrative for Property 
Located Five Hundred Feet Northeast of the Intersection of County Road 64 and Dixon Lane 

  B. 2026-13 - Ordinance to Amend The Italian Village of Daphne PUD Narrative for Property 
Located Northwest of the Intersection of County Road 64 and Alabama Highway 181 

  C. 2026-14 - Ordinance to Pre-Zone Property Located Northwest of County Road 64 and Alabama 
Highway 181 

  D. 2026-15 - Ordinance to Annex Property Contiguous to the Corporate Limits of the City of 
Daphne 

  E. 2026-16 - Ordinance Amending Chapter 15 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Daphne 
Relating to Daphne City Park Rules and Regulations 
 
  

Page 13 of 135



June 1, 2026 
CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
6:00 P.M. 

 

Pa
ge

5

 
MOTION by Councilman Coleman to waive the reading of Ordinances 2026-12, 2026-13, 2026-14, 2026-

15 and 2026-16. Seconded by Councilwoman Green.  
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.  

 
MOTION by Councilman Olen to adopt Ordinance 2026-12. Seconded by Councilwoman Conaway.  

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.  
 

MOTION by Councilman Olen to adopt Ordinance 2026-13. Seconded by Councilman Roberts.  
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 

 
MOTION by Councilman Olen to adopt Ordinance 2026-14. Seconded by Councilwoman Conaway.  

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 
 

MOTION by Councilman Olen to adopt Ordinance 2026-15. Seconded by Councilman Coleman.  
MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 

 
MOTION by Councilman Olen to adopt Ordinance 2026-16. Seconded by Councilwoman Green. 

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY. 
 
13.        1st READ ORDINANCES:  

  A. 2026-17 - Zoning District Map - Revisions to the City of Daphne Land Use and Development 
Ordinance 

  B. 2026-18 - Ordinance to Annex Property Continguous to the Corporate Limits of the City of 
Daphne — Northwest of County Road 64 and Alabama Highway 181 - Joseph A. Allegri Jr 
Properties I, LLC; Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties II, LLC; Jerry and Louise Volovecky Sr. 
Family Limited Partnership 

  C. 2026-19 - Ordinance Amending the City of Daphne's Garbage Collection Ordinance No. 2017-
59, as Codified in Chapter 12, Article III, Daphne Code of Ordinances 

14.       COUNCIL COMMENTS 

Councilwoman Conaway thanked Chief Tacon and recognized Fire Rescue and Public Works for their work.  
 
Councilman Olen congratulated Public Works on their award and thanks Fire Rescue.  
 
Councilman Coleman echoed the previous comments and thanked Dr. Carpenter for his message.  
 
Councilman Roberts echoed the previous comments.  
 
Councilman Green echoes the previous comments, thanked the fire hydrant decorating crew for helping the 
hydrant become part of the community, thanked the SROs and the website workers. 
 
Mayor LeJeune thanked the fire crew for the work on the hydrant, discussed the June 26th America 250 event 
and noted that the Alabama Nations Guard band will be giving a free concert on the history of music.  

Page 14 of 135



June 1, 2026 
CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
REGULAR BUSINESS MEETING 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
6:00 P.M. 

 

Pa
ge

6

 
Councilman Hughes highlighted the awesome events in Daphne.  
 

15.  ADJOURN: 

THERE BEING NO FURTHER BUSINESS TO DISCUSS, COUNCIL ADJOURNED AT 6:40PM. 

Respectfully submitted by,                                  Certification of Presiding Officer,    

 
_________________________________    __________________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk       Benjamin Hughes, Council President 

Page 15 of 135



2022 2023 2024 2025 2026 2022 2023 2024 2025 2026 2022 2023 2024 2025 2026

Oct $84,303.63 $47,086.96 $83,607.35 $143,569.06 $77,524.20 308 192 223 213 189 40 28 32 17 25

Nov $91,672.49 $50,279.03 $27,758.62 $58,210.00 $219,396.48 351 286 166 142 216 30 36 23 12 9

Dec $128,605.99 $57,070.59 $40,344.17 $50,271.68 $36,647.91 296 216 181 150 245 53 36 33 25 12

Jan $259,810.62 $33,804.54 $163,953.56 $80,404.50 $44,321.08 350 152 295 173 120 36 33 25 20 11

Feb $129,315.56 $44,081.76 $84,412.27 $37,199.09 $58,004.87 292 169 229 163 168 32 31 23 20 7

Mar $116,358.20 $30,603.28 $57,825.99 $320,154.95 $115,389.98 431 181 240 165 190 84 44 24 16 25

Apr $60,816.35 $76,873.19 $171,191.80 $89,713.72 $51,613.31 324 212 348 202 159 42 27 15 19 20

May $65,454.25 $147,875.62 $207,947.06 $155,349.01 $66,512.50 306 288 368 211 178 48 20 30 17 17

June $147,395.66 $234,524.02 $58,420.91 $143,387.48 355 308 232 230 34 25 43 21

July $87,733.72 $100,809.42 $69,318.38 $78,117.48 305 267 273 185 23 13 33 15

Aug $61,504.63 $60,342.37 $181,357.78 $65,814.58 299 192 239 182 19 4 29 11

Sept $140,065.18 $108,322.22 $189,261.78 $106,073.70 328 277 344 147 40 34 20 15

Total $1,373,036.28 $991,673.00 $1,335,399.67 $1,328,265.25 $669,410.33 3945 2740 3138 2,163 1,465 481 331 330 208 126

Percent +- N/A -27.78% 34.66% -0.53% N/A -30.54% 14.53% -31.07% N/A -31.19% -0.30% -93.64%

City of Daphne Building Department
    2022 / 2023 / 2024 / 2025 / 2026 Comparison Report

CO's IssuedFee's Collected Permit's Issued

Infirmary Health, The Croft, Aldi, and Daphne Amphitheater are in progress.  Chase Bank has started. 

May FY2026 Building Inspections- 

$66512.50 Fee's Collected, 178 Permits issued, 17 Certificate Of Occupancies issued and  10 New Residential Homes permitted 

Page 16 of 135



BUILDINGS & PROPERTY COMMITTEE MEETING 
May 11, 2026 5:15 p.m. 

City Hall, Jubilee Conference Room  
1705 Main Street, Daphne, AL 36526 

 
MEETING MINUTES    

MEMBERS PRESENT:    Councilman Hughes, Councilwoman Messinger, Councilman Olen, Councilwoman 
Green, Councilman Coleman and Councilman Roberts  

MEMBERS ABSENT:  Councilwoman Conaway 

ALSO PRESENT:  Patrick Dungan, City Attorney; Troy Strunk, City Development; Mayor LeJeune; Andy 
Bobe, City Engineer; Kara Wilbourn, Marketing; Jennifer Rulon, Senior Center; Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk; 
Bobby Purvis, Public Works; Charlie McDavid, Recreation; Emmie Powell, Library; and Ange Baggett, 
Marketing.  

1) CALL MEETING TO ORDER / ROLL CALL 

There being a quorum present Councilwoman Messinger called the meeting to order at 5:15p.m. 

2) MINUTES 

Councilman Messinger reviewed the minutes from the April 13, 2026 meeting. 

3) PUBLIC PARTICIPATION  

No public participation. 

4) BUILDING INSPECTION REPORT 

Troy Strunk shared that demolition has begun on 505 Van Avenue. 

5)         CIVIC CENTER & BAYFRONT PAVILION REPORT  

Ange Baggett gave the Civic Center report and review of the March 9, 2026, Museum minutes. 

6)         RECREATION REPORT  

Charlie McDavid gave the Recreation report and the Senior Center report. Mr. McDavid also shared that the 
alligator was removed from the Sports Complex. 

7)         LIBRARY REPORT 

Emmie Powell gave the Library report. 

8)         FACILITIES REPORT 

Bobby Purvis gave the Facilities Report.  

9)  OLD BUSINESS 

10) NEW BUSINESS  

Kara Wilbourn shared a presentation of the new City website that will launch on May 27, 2026. 

11)        ANY OTHER BUILDINGS AND PROPERTY BUSINESS 

12)        NEXT MEETING 

The next meeting is scheduled for Monday, June 8, 2026 at 5:15 p.m. 
 
13)        ADJOURN 

There being no further business to discuss, the Committee adjourned at 5:56pm.  

Page 17 of 135



May 11, 2026 
PUBLIC SAFETY MEETING MINUTES 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
4:30 P.M. 

 

 
 
 

1.  CALL TO ORDER: 

There being a quorum present, the meeting was called to order at 4:30 p.m. by Councilwoman Jennifer Green.       

2. ROLL CALL: 

COUNCIL MEMBERS PRESENT:  Councilmen Oliver Roberts, Joel Coleman, Benjamin Hughes, Steve 
Olen and Councilwoman Stephanie Messenger. 

ABSENT: Councilwoman Tommie Conaway. 

Also Present: Mayor LeJeune, City Attorney; Patrick Dungan, Troy Strunk, Fire Department; Lamar Green, 
Police Department; Chief Gulsby, City Clerk; Cindy Beaudreau, Recording Secretary; Christina Brazell. 

Junior City Council present: none 

3. PUBLIC PARTICIPATION:   
 

Mary Nelson: Resides at Sunset Bay Villas.  Requested a traffic light at the intersection of US Hwy 98 and Yacht 
Club Dr.  Safety Concerns.  Mayor LeJeune advised her that this request will need to be forwarded to the state.  
He would reach out to ALDOT.  She was welcomed to provide any supporting documents concerning her 
request.  She provided council with a petition signed by her surrounding neighbors. 
 
Sandy Robinson:1500 Main St.  She had a concern regarding individuals riding e-bikes on the Mayday Park 
Pier.  Troy Strunk advised that the signs were completed and would be installed soon. 
 
Kurt Fondler: Randall Ave.  Wanted to know if the City could share the cost on the traffic light request on US 
Highway 90 & Yacht Club Dr. 
 
Tom Walker wanted to wish everyone a Happy Mother’s Day. 
 

4.  APPROVAL OF MINUTES FROM PREVIOUS MEETING 
  

Minutes from April 2026 Public Safety meeting approved as presented. 
 
5. POLICE DEPARTMENT – Chief Gulsby 
  

Old Business:  None 
 
New Business: (Stats provided) 
Discussion regarding the brand-new interceptor that had a motor catch fire.  It is currently getting a new engine 
installed. 
Staffing Discussion: (Patrol opening), 8 individuals interviewed. 4 of the 8 are proceeding to the PT test. 
Houston Sanders is set to retire this month, as well as one dispatcher has resigned. 
40 Applications were received regarding the open position with Code Enforcement.   

Page 2 of 6Page 18 of 135



May 11, 2026 
PUBLIC SAFETY MEETING MINUTES 
1705 MAIN STREET 
DAPHNE, AL 
4:30 P.M. 

 

 
 

6.  FIRE DEPARTMENT: - Chief Tacon  
 
Old Business:   None. 
 
New Business: (Stats provided)   
Chief Lamar Green advised that there were 3 mutual aid responses last month as well as 5 ride ins. 
April 26th, 2026 DFD received a call regarding stranded kayakers in the Bay.  All individuals were brought back 
to safety.  Chief Green wanted the Council to be aware that the Police and Fire Department staff on scene were 
able to set up a unified command that worked very well together and made this rescue possible.   
 
Medstar Discussion: 95 % compliance as of last month, according to their records and reports.  At this time, they 
are currently working with 8 trucks in our area. 

 
7. OTHER BUSINESS:  Barrington Lane Study 
 

Chief Gulsby provided council with results of the study.  In 4 weeks, 13,000 vehicles were recorded.  8 vehicles 
were documented speeding.  Council agreed no further action needed. 

Councilwoman Messenger wanted to address the timing on the light at State Highway 181 and Urgent Care Dr.  
She stated that the light does not allow more than 3 vehicles out before changing.   

     
 
Adjournment 5:00 p.m. 

Page 3 of 6Page 19 of 135



Page 20 of 135



Page 21 of 135



Page 22 of 135



Page 23 of 135



Page 24 of 135



Page 25 of 135



Page 26 of 135



Page 27 of 135



Page 28 of 135



Page 29 of 135



Page 30 of 135



Page 31 of 135



Page 32 of 135



Page 33 of 135



Page 34 of 135



Page 35 of 135



Page 36 of 135



Page 37 of 135



Page 38 of 135



Page 39 of 135



Page 40 of 135



Page 41 of 135



Page 42 of 135



Page 43 of 135



Page 44 of 135



Page 45 of 135



Page 46 of 135



Page 47 of 135



Page 48 of 135



Page 49 of 135



Page 50 of 135



Page 51 of 135



Page 52 of 135



Page 53 of 135



Page 54 of 135



Page 55 of 135



Page 56 of 135



Page 57 of 135



Page 58 of 135



Page 59 of 135



Page 60 of 135



Page 61 of 135



Page 62 of 135



Page 63 of 135



Page 64 of 135



Page 65 of 135



Page 66 of 135



Page 67 of 135



Page 68 of 135



Page 69 of 135



Page 70 of 135



Page 71 of 135



Page 72 of 135



Page 73 of 135



Page 74 of 135



Page 75 of 135



Page 76 of 135



Page 77 of 135



Page 78 of 135



Page 79 of 135



Page 80 of 135



Page 81 of 135



Page 82 of 135



Page 83 of 135



Page 84 of 135



Page 85 of 135



Page 86 of 135



Page 87 of 135



Page 88 of 135



Page 89 of 135



Page 90 of 135



Page 91 of 135



Page 92 of 135



Page 93 of 135



Page 94 of 135



Page 95 of 135



Page 96 of 135



Page 97 of 135



Page 98 of 135



Page 99 of 135



Page 100 of 135



Page 101 of 135



Page 102 of 135



Page 103 of 135



Page 104 of 135



Page 105 of 135



Page 106 of 135



Page 107 of 135



Page 108 of 135



Page 109 of 135



Page 110 of 135



Page 111 of 135



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 

ORDINANCE 2026-17 

 

Zoning District Map 

Revision to the City of Daphne Land Use and Development Ordinance 

 

WHEREAS, the Planning Commission of the City of Daphne, Alabama at their regular meeting 

held on April 23, 2026, favorably recommended to the City Council of the City of Daphne certain 

amendments to the Daphne Land Use and Development Ordinance / Zoning District Map approved and 

adopted by Ordinance No. 2011-54, referenced in Appendix H “Exhibit A” thereof, and amended by 

Ordinance No. 2016-69, Ordinance No. 2017-49, Ordinance No. 2018-02, Ordinance 2018-27, 

Ordinance 2019-19, Ordinance 2020-12, Ordinance 2020-28, Ordinance 2022-20, Ordinance 2022-51, 

Ordinance 2023-44, Ordinance 2024-18, Ordinance 2024-42, Ordinance 2025-12;. Ordinance 2026-01 

and 

 

WHEREAS, said amendments are necessary due to various rezoning and annexation requests 

which have been approved since the adoption of Ordinance No. 2026-01; and 

 

WHEREAS, due notice of said proposed zoning map amendments has been provided to the 

public as required by law through publication and open display at the City of Daphne Public Library and 

City Hall; and 

 

WHEREAS, a public hearing regarding the proposed Zoning District Map amendments was 

held by the City Council on June 1, 2026; and 

 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Daphne after due consideration and upon 

recommendation of the Planning Commission believe it in the best interest of the health, safety and 

welfare of the citizens of the City of Daphne to amend said Zoning District Map as recommended; and 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

DAPHNE, ALABAMA, as follows: 

 

SECTION I: ZONING DISTRICT MAP 

 

The Zoning District Map referenced hereto as Exhibit “A” shall be the official zoning map of the 

City of Daphne, Alabama and shall be further designated in Appendix H of the City of Daphne Land Use 

and Development Ordinance, as set forth in Ordinance No. 2011-54 and its amendments. 

 

SECTION II: REPEALER 

 

Ordinance No. 2011-54, Appendix H “Exhibit A”, Ordinance No. 2016-69, Ordinance No. 2017-

49, Ordinance No. 2018-02, Ordinance 2018-27, Ordinance 2019-19, Ordinance 2020-12, Ordinance 

2020-28, Ordinance 2022-20, Ordinance 2022-51, Ordinance 2023-44, Ordinance 2024-18, Ordinance 

2024-18 and Ordinance 2025-12, Ordinance 2026-01 are hereby repealed, and any Ordinance(s), parts 

of Ordinance(s) or Resolution(s) conflicting with the provisions of this Ordinance are hereby repealed 

insofar as they conflict. 

 

 

Page 112 of 135



SECTION III: EFFECTIVE DATE 

 

This Ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after the date of its approval by the 

City of Daphne City Council and publication as required by law. 

 

 

ADOPTED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DAPHNE, 

ALABAMA ON THIS _____DAY OF _________, 2026. 

                                                                                

                              

 

             

         ____________________________ 

Robin LeJeune, Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

 

__________________________________ 

Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk 

Page 113 of 135



Page 114 of 135



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE 2026 - 18 

 
ORDINANCE RATIFYING, CONFIRMING, AND REAFFIRMING  

THE ANNEXATION OF PROPERTY CONTIGUOUS TO THE  
CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF DAPHNE 

 
Northwest of County Road 64 and Alabama Highway 181 

Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC; Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties II, LLC; Jerry 
and Louise Volovecky Sr. Family Limited Partnership 

(Confirmation and Ratification of Prior Annexation) 
 

 WHEREAS, on the 18th day of November, 2025, Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties II, LLC, Jerry 
and Louise Volovecky Sr. Family Limited Partnership as the owners of certain real property 
hereinafter described, did file with the City Clerk a petition requesting that said tracts or parcels of 
land be annexed into and become part of the City of Daphne, Alabama (the “City”); and 
 
 WHEREAS, said petition did contain an accurate description of the property to be annexed 
together with a map of the said territory showing its relationship to the corporate limits of the City of 
Daphne, Alabama, and the signatures of the owners of the property described; and 
 

WHEREAS, on April 6, 2026, the City Council considered and adopted Ordinance 2026-08 to 
annex the Property, which was recorded in the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County at 
Instrument Number 2252834; and 
 
 WHEREAS, subsequent to the filing of said petition, an additional record owner of a portion of 
the property, Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC, has executed a Joinder and Ratification of the 
petition for annexation, which is on file with the City Clerk; and 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that Ordinance 2026-08 effectively annexed the Property 
into the corporate limits of the City and that the Joinder and Ratification executed by Joseph A. 
Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC confirms the consent of all record owners to such annexation; 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council desires to ratify, confirm, and reaffirm the annexation approved 

by Ordinance 2026-08 and to incorporate the Joinder and Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri 
Jr Properties I, LLC into the record of such annexation; and 

 
WHEREAS, after proper publication, a public hearing was held by the City Council on June 15, 

2026, concerning the petition for annexation. 
 
 NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
DAPHNE, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS: 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 115 of 135



2 

 SECTION ONE:   RATIFICATION, CONFIRMATION, AND REAFFIRMATION OF 
    PRIOR ANNEXATION 
 
 The City Council of the City of Daphne finds and declares as the legislative body of the City that 
it is in the best interest of the citizens of the City and the citizens of the affected area to ratify, confirm, 
and reaffirm the annexation of the property described in Section Three, which property was 
previously annexed into the corporate limits of the City pursuant to Ordinance 2026-08.  The Joinder 
and Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC is incorporated herein by 
reference and made a part of the record of this annexation. The City Council hereby ratifies, confirms, 
and reaffirms the annexation approved by Ordinance 2026-08 and finds that the Joinder and 
Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC cures any deficiency arising from the 
omission of that entity from the original petition. 
 

SECTION TWO: ZONING 
 
 At its April 6, 2026 meeting, the City Council adopted Ordinance 2026-07 pre-zoning the property 
described herein as PUD (Planned Unit Development). 
 
 SECTION THREE:  DESCRIPTION OF TERRITORY 
 
 The City Council hereby ratifies and confirms the annexation of the territory described below, 
which territory was previously annexed into the corporate limits of the City pursuant to Ordinance 
2026-08: 

 
Legal Description:  
 

A parcel of land situated in the South one-half of the Southeast one-quarter of Section 
15, Township 5 South, Range 2 East, Baldwin County, Alabama being more particularly 
described as follows: 

BEGIN at a found 1/2 inch rebar marking the Southeast corner of Lot 1-B according 
to the Replat of Lot 1 Volovecky Split Subdivision as recorded in Slide 0003046-C in the 
Office of the Judge of Probate, Baldwin County, Alabama and lying on the West right-of-way 
of State Highway 181; thence leaving said Lot 1-B run South 00 degrees 21 minutes 12 
seconds East along said right-of-way for a distance of 509.93 feet to a found concrete 
monument lying on said right-of-way; thence run South 15 degrees 48 minutes 33 seconds 
East along said right-of-way for a distance of 54.74 feet to a found concrete monument lying 
on said right-of-way; thence leaving said right-of-way run North 88 degrees 54 minutes 29 
seconds West for a distance of 187.99 feet to a found capped rebar stamped Fairhope; thence 
run South 00 degrees 04 minutes 35 seconds West for a distance of 224.97 feet to a found 
capped rebar lying on the North right-of-way of County Road 64; thence run North 89 degrees 
36 minutes 46 seconds West along said right-of-way for a distance of 1396.57 feet to a set 5/8 
inch capped rebar stamped CA-560LS lying on said right-of-way; thence leaving said right-
of-way run North 00 degrees 23 minutes 14 seconds East for a distance of 785.49 feet to a set 
5/8 inch capped rebar stamped CA-560LS lying on the South line of said Lot 1-A of the 
aforementioned subdivision; thence run South 89 degrees 36 minutes 02 seconds East along 
said the South line of said Lot 1-A for a distance of 663.67 feet to a set 5/8 inch capped rebar 
stamped CA-560LS marking a corner on the South line of said Lot 1-A and marking the 

Page 116 of 135



3 

Southwest corner of said Lot 1-B; thence leaving said Lot 1-A continue along the previously 
described call and the South line of said Lot 1-B for a distance of 904.08 feet to the POINT 
OF BEGINNING. Said parcel contains 1,193,213 square feet or 27.39 acres, more or less. 

 
Lot 1-B, Replat of Volovecky Split Subdivision, according to the plat thereof, as 

recorded on Slide 0003046-C in the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County, 
Alabama. 

 
SECTION FOUR:   REFERENCE TO PREVIOUSLY RECORDED   

        ANNEXATION MAP 
 

The map depicting the territory annexed by Ordinance 2026-08 is incorporated herein by 
reference. Said map was attached to and recorded with Ordinance 2026-08 in the Office of the Judge 
of Probate of Baldwin County, Alabama, at Instrument Number 2252834. 

 
SECTION FIVE:    RATIFICATION OF PRIOR ORDINANCE 
 

 Ordinance 2026-08, recorded in the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County, Alabama, 
at Instrument Number 2252834, is hereby ratified, confirmed, and reaffirmed in all respects. The City 
Council finds that the territory described therein was properly annexed into the corporate limits of 
the City and that the Joinder and Ratification executed by Joseph A. Allegri Jr Properties I, LLC 
confirms the consent of all record owners to such annexation. Nothing herein shall be construed as 
rescinding, replacing, or nullifying Ordinance 2026-08. 

 
SECTION SIX:    EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

 
 This Ordinance shall become effective upon publication as required by law and shall serve to 
ratify, confirm, and reaffirm the annexation previously approved by Ordinance 2026-08. A certified 
copy of this Ordinance shall be filed with the Office of the Judge of Probate of Baldwin County, 
Alabama.  
 
 
 APPROVED AND ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DAPHNE, 
ALABAMA, THIS 15TH DAY OF JUNE, 2026. 
 
 

 
 _________________________________ 
 Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
___________________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk 

 

Page 117 of 135



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE NO.  2026-19 

 
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE CITY OF DAPHNE’S 

GARBAGE COLLECTION ORDINANCE NO. 2017-59, AS CODIFIED IN CHAPTER 
12, ARTICLE III, DAPHNE CODE OF ORDINANCES 

 WHEREAS, Ordinance 2017-59 established regulations governing the collection of 
garbage in the City of Daphne (the “City”), and those regulations are codified in Article III of 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, as previously amended; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the orderly and efficient collection of garbage is 
necessary to protect the public health, safety, and welfare of the residents of the City of Daphne; 
and 

 WHEREAS, the City desires to update its garbage collection regulations to reflect current 
solid waste collection practices, including the use of City-approved semi-automated receptacles 
and related placement requirements; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council further finds that clarification of the City’s garbage 
receptacle requirements, collection placement deadlines, and related operational rules will assist 
residents, City staff, and collection personnel in the consistent administration and enforcement of 
the Garbage Collection Ordinance; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council therefore finds it necessary and appropriate to amend 
Division 1, Article III, Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, commonly referred to as 
the City’s Garbage Collection Ordinance, to promote efficient garbage collection and continued 
protection of public health and safety. 

  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA as follows:  

SECTION 1.   AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE 2017-59, SECTION II 
   (CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE III, DIVISION 1, SEC. 12-31) –   
   DEFINITIONS 
 Section I of Ordinance 2017-59, as codified at Section 12-31 of Division 1, Article III, 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, is hereby amended by repealing and replacing the 
definition of “Garbage receptacle” in its entirety with the following:  

 Garbage receptacle. The term “garbage receptacle” shall mean a container 
provided by the City of Daphne and approved for use as a garbage container, consisting of 
either (a) a sixty-four (64) gallon semi-automated receptacle, or (b) a ninety-six (96) gallon 
semi-automated receptacle. 

 

Page 118 of 135



2 
 

SECTION 2.   AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE 2017-59, SECTION III 
   (CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE III, DIVISION 1, SEC. 12-33) –   
   REQUIREMENTS FOR GARBAGE REMOVAL 
 Section III of Ordinance 2017-59, as codified at Section 12-33 of Division 1, Article III, 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, is hereby amended by repealing and replacing 
subsections (a) and (d) in their entirety with the following:  

(a) Residential. All residents and occupants of residential units in Daphne, Alabama, shall be 
required to have accumulations of garbage removed and disposed of by: (1) the City of 
Daphne Solid Waste Department or a contractor to whom the City of Daphne has granted 
a franchise, (2) transporting to approved bulk containers or approved disposal sites, or (3) 
obtaining a permit from the health department to transport to a landfill. The City of Daphne 
will provide an initial ninety-six (96) gallon semi-automated or sixty-four (64) gallon semi-
automated garbage receptacle. 

(b) … 
(c) … 
(d) Placement. All garbage must be placed at the curbside within six (6) feet of the street no 

later than midnight preceding the scheduled collection day. No garbage shall be placed at 
the curbside more than twenty-four (24) hours prior to the day scheduled for pick up. If 
trash and garbage are scheduled for collection on the same day, materials should be neatly 
placed in separate areas of the curbside. Containers shall be removed from the curbside 
within twelve (12) hours after collection has occurred. Any garbage receptacle placed that 
does not follow these guidelines may not be collected. Please note that your collection time 
may vary from day to day.  

 
SECTION 3.   AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE 2017-59, SECTION IV 
   (CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE III, DIVISION 1, SEC. 12-34) –   
   PREPARATION AND RECEPTACLE REQUIREMENTS 
 Section IV of Ordinance 2017-59, as codified at Section 12-34 of Division 1, Article III, 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, is hereby amended by repealing and replacing 
subsections (b) and (c) in their entirety with the following:  

(a) … 
(b) Location of receptacles; residential. Garbage receptacles shall be placed at ground level, 

within six (6) feet from the roadway on the property of the residential unit or commercial 
establishment which has accumulated the garbage, and shall not be kept upon city, county, 
or public property or neighboring property not in the ownership or tenancy of the person 
by whom the garbage is accumulated, whether such neighboring property be vacant or 
improved except that it may be kept on the city right-of-way. In the case of multiple 
garbage receptacles, each garbage receptacle shall be placed at least four (4) feet from any 
other garbage receptacle. Such placement of garbage receptacles shall be easily accessible 
to the code enforcement officer for inspection and to employees of the contractor for 
collection. 
(1) Garbage shall be neatly placed so as to allow convenient passage of persons and 

vehicles on the roadway. At no time shall a receptacle or garbage be placed in a 
street, drainage ditch, storm drain, or gutter, nor should it be placed near trees, 
power lines, street signs, or near utility, cable, or telephone equipment. If garbage 

Page 119 of 135



3 
 

is placed near service equipment and damage occurs to said equipment due to 
collection efforts, the property owner shall be responsible for all necessary repairs 
or replacements. 

(2) Ownership of and responsibility for garbage material shall remain with the producer 
until collected. 

(c) Minimum receptacle specifications. 
(1) Receptacles required. All garbage must be placed in bags and the bags placed in 

garbage receptacles as defined herein. Such receptacles shall be in sufficient 
number to hold all garbage produced between regular collections.  

(2) Commercial receptacle exceptions. Garbage from commercial establishments may 
be stored or collected in a container designed for mechanical pickup provided that 
such container and the location of such container have been approved by the code 
enforcement officer. 

(3) Improper receptacles. Any container used for the collection or storage of garbage 
failing to meet the requirements of this section shall be clearly marked or identified 
by a code enforcement officer, which marking or identification shall legibly specify 
in what manner the container fails to meet the requirements of garbage receptacles. 
Any container so tagged must be replaced with an acceptable garbage receptacle 
within five (5) days after notification by the code enforcement officer. The City 
will not be responsible for collecting garbage that is not properly prepared and 
placed in approved garbage receptacles. 

(d) … 

SECTION 4.   SEVERABILITY 
 If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this ordinance is for any 
reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such portion shall 
be deemed a separate, distinct, and independent provision and such holding shall not affect the 
validity of the remaining portions hereof. 
 
SECTION 5.   SURVIVAL AND REPEALER 
 All other provisions of Ordinance 2017-59 not amended or repealed by this Ordinance 
remain in full effect. All other City Ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the provisions of 
this Ordinance, in so far as they conflict, are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.   
 
SECTION 6.   EFFECTIVE DATE 
 This Ordinance shall be effective upon its due adoption by the City Council and publication 
as required by law.   
 

 ADOPTED AND APPROVED on this ____ day of ___________, 2026.  
 
                                                             __________________________________ 
       Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk  

Page 120 of 135



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE 2026-20 

 
AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING A TEMPORARY MORATORIUM ON THE 

ACCEPTANCE AND PROCESSING OF CERTAIN APPLICATIONS FOR MULTI-
FAMILY, GARDEN APARTMENT DEVELOPMENT PENDING COMPREHENSIVE 

REVISIONS TO THE CITY’S LAND USE AND DEVELOPMENT ORDINANCE 
 

 WHEREAS, the City of Daphne is currently engaged in a comprehensive review and 
overhaul of its Land Use and Development Ordinance (“LUDO”), including provisions relating to 
zoning classifications, development standards, density, infrastructure impacts, stormwater 
management, and compatibility of land uses; 
 WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that the existing provisions of the LUDO 
applicable to apartment development may require substantial revision as part of that ongoing 
process; 
 WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the acceptance and processing of new applications 
for apartment developments during the pendency of the LUDO overhaul could result in projects 
being reviewed under standards that are likely to be materially revised in the near future; 
 WHEREAS, the City Council further finds that a temporary moratorium of limited 
duration and scope is necessary to allow the City sufficient time to complete and consider such 
revisions in an orderly manner and to protect the public health, safety, and general welfare;  
 WHEREAS, the City Council intends for this moratorium to be limited to new apartment 
developments and not to interfere with previously approved developments or other residential 
housing types authorized under the LUDO; and 
 WHEREAS, the City Council finds that this temporary moratorium is a reasonable and 
narrowly tailored measure intended to preserve the status quo while the City completes its ongoing 
planning and ordinance revision efforts. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF DAPHNE, as follows: 
 

1. Temporary Moratorium. Effective immediately upon adoption of this Ordinance, 
the City shall not accept, process, or approve any application for rezoning, pre-zoning, site plan 
approval, master plan approval, planned development approval, or other development approval for 
any new apartment development within the corporate limits of the City of Daphne. For purposes 
of this Ordinance, “apartment development” means a residential development classified as a 
“Multi-Family, Garden Apartment” development as defined in the LUDO, including such 
developments proposed within the R-7(A) Apartment District, R-4 High Density Single & High 
Density Multi-Family Residential District, and any Planned Unit Development (PUD) containing 
a Multi-Family, Garden Apartment component. This Ordinance shall not apply to townhomes, 
duplexes, condominiums, single-family detached dwellings, or other residential development 
types that are not classified as apartment developments under the LUDO. 
 

Page 121 of 135



2 
 

2. Exemptions. This moratorium shall not apply to:  
 (a) applications determined by the City to be complete and accepted for review 
prior to the effective date of this Ordinance; 
 (b) applications currently pending before the Planning Commission or City Council 
as of the effective date of this Ordinance; 
 (c) developments for which final site plan approval has already been granted prior 
to the effective date of this Ordinance; or 
 (d) any Planned Unit Development that, prior to the effective date of this Ordinance, 
has received approval of its PUD zoning and master development plan, including any 
future site plan application, amendment, or phase that is substantially consistent with the 
previously approved PUD and master development plan. 

3. Effective Period. The moratorium shall be effective immediately upon adoption 
and publication as required by law and shall remain in effect for a period of one hundred eighty 
(180) days unless sooner terminated or extended by action of the City Council.  

4. Severability. Should any provision of this Ordinance, or its application to any 
person or circumstance, be declared unconstitutional or otherwise invalid for any reason, or should 
any provision of this Ordinance be pre-empted by State of Federal law or regulation, such decision 
of pre-emption shall not affect the validity of the remaining provisions of this Ordinance or its 
application to other persons or circumstances.  
 

ADOPTED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
DAPHNE, ALABAMA, ON THIS THE ____ DAY OF __________, 2026.  
 
    
       ________________________________ 
       Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk 
 

Page 122 of 135



1 
 

CITY OF DAPHNE 
ORDINANCE 2026-21 

 
FIRE PREVENTION CODE FOR THE CITY OF DAPHNE 

 
AN ORDINANCE TO REPEAL ORDINANCE NO. 2019-33 AND ADOPT THE 2024 

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS THERETO FOR THE CITY OF 
DAPHNE, ALABAMA. 

 
 WHEREAS, the 2024 edition of the International Fire Code, including Appendix Chapters 
A, B, C, D, E, F, H, I, and N copyrighted by the International Code Council, with amendments 
thereto, has heretofore been on file in the Office of the City Clerk of the City of Daphne, Alabama; 
and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Daphne has determined that it is in the best 
interest of the health, safety, and welfare of its citizens to adopt the 2024 edition of the International 
Fire Code, as amended herein. 

   
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA, AS FOLLOWS: 

 
SECTION 1.  ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, EDITION 2018 
 
Section 101.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 
A. 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Daphne, 
hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 
 
B. Section 103.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 
      103.1 Creation of Agency. The City of Daphne Bureau of Fire Prevention is hereby created, 
and the person in charge shall be known in this Code as the Fire Code Official, who shall be the 
Fire Marshal of the City of Daphne. The function of the department shall be the implementation, 
administration, and enforcement of the provisions of this code and amendments. 

 
 
C. Section 103.2 Appointment of the Fire Code Official shall be deleted in its entirety. 
 
D.  Section 105.1.2.2 insert “Unauthorized work.” 

1) Where work for which a permit is required by this code commences prior to obtaining 
said permit, the permit fee herein specified shall be doubled plus $100.” 
 

E. Section 113.4 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 

113.4 Violation penalties.  Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, repairs, or does work 
in violation of the approved construction documents or any directive of the fire code official, or of 
a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a Fire Code Violation, 

Page 123 of 135



2 
 

punishable by a fine as determined by the Municipal Court Judge or by imprisonment as 
determined by the Municipal Court Judge, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a 
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.  
 
F. Section 114.4 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 

114.4 Failure to comply.  Any person who shall continue any work after having been served 
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation 
or unsafe condition, shall be liable and subject to penalties as determined by the Municipal Court 
Judge. 
 
G. Section 307.2 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 

307.2 Permit required.  A permit shall be obtained from the Bureau of Fire Prevention in 
accordance with section 105.5 prior to kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or range wildlife 
management practices, prevention or control of disease or pests, bonfires, and open burning.  
Application for such approval shall only be presented by a permit issued to the owner of the land 
on which the fire is to be kindled.  
 
H. Section 505.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 

505.1 Address identification. New and existing buildings shall be provided with approved 
address identification.  The address identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is 
visible from the street or road fronting the property.  Address identification characters shall 
contrast with their background.  Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters.  
Numbers shall not be spelled out.  Each character shall be not less than 5 inches high with a 
maximum stroke width of ½ inch.  Where required by the fire code official, address identification 
shall be provided in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response.  Where access 
is by means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, 
pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure.  Address identification shall be 
maintained. 
 
I. Section 506.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

  
506.1 Key boxes. Key boxes shall be installed in all buildings having two or more units/suites, 

or having an automatic fire sprinkler system, fire alarm system or any alarm that generates a fire 
department response.  The Fire Code Official shall also have the authority to require a key box to 
be installed in an accessible location where access to or within a structure or area is difficult 
because of security. The key box shall be of and approved type and shall contain keys to gain 
necessary access as required by the Fire Code Official. 
 
J. Section 507.5.1.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
   

507.5.1.1 Hydrant for fire sprinkler systems and standpipe Systems.  Buildings equipped 
with a standpipe or fire sprinkler system installed in accordance with Chapter 9 shall have a fire 
hydrant within 100 feet of the FDC (fire department connection).  
 

Page 124 of 135



3 
 

K. Add Section 901.2.1.1 Permit application requirements. All sprinkler and fire alarm 
design drawings submitted to the fire department for review shall abide by the Alabama State 
Board of Licensure for Professional Engineers and Land Surveyors' fire protection position 
statement. NICET certification does not replace the requirement for professional licensure. The 
designing of fire protection and detection systems is engineering and, as such, must be designed 
by or under the direct supervision of professional engineers qualified to design fire protection and 
detection systems. Only fire protection and detection designs that have been signed and sealed by 
a qualified Alabama licensed professional engineer shall be approved for construction." 
 
L.  Add Section 901.2.1.2 Contractor qualification requirements. Copies of applicable permits, 
certifications, current Daphne Business License and a current one million dollar ($1,000,000) 
general liability insurance policy with the City of Daphne listed as a certificate holder, P.O. Box 
400, Daphne, AL 36526 shall be submitted to the Fire Marshal for review. 
 

1) Restaurant Fixed Extinguishing Systems: 
• The qualifier must possess manufacturer certification (which restricts them to that manufacturer) 
and/or NAFED/ICC 
certification (which would allow them to be unrestricted and service, maintain, or install any 
system). 
 

2) Sprinkler Systems: 
• Must possess a current sprinkler permit through the Alabama State Fire Marshal's Office and 
applicable NICET 
certification. 
 

3) Fire Alarm Systems: 
• Must possess a fire alarm permit through the Alabama State Fire Marshal's Office and applicable 
NICET certification. 
Must possess a minimum of NICET II to perform technician work, or work under the direct 
supervision of a NICET II. 
 

4) Portable Fire Extinguishers: 
• Current certificate of training on portable fire extinguishers in compliance with NFPA 10." 
 
M. Section 905.3.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 

905.3.1 Building height.  Class III standpipe systems shall be installed throughout 
buildings where the floor level of the highest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) above 
the lowest level of the fire department vehicle access, or where the floor level of the lowest story 
is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) below the highest level of fire department vehicle access. 
A class I, Manual Wet, standpipe system shall be installed in a building where the floor level of 
the highest story is located more than 20 feet above the lowest level of the fire department vehicle 
access. 
 
N. Section D107.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 

Page 125 of 135



4 
 

D107.1 One- or two-family dwelling residential developments. It is recommended that 
developments of one- or two-family dwellings where the number of dwelling units exceeds 30, be 
provided with two separate and approved fire apparatus access roads. 
 
SECTION 2: ORDINANCES REPEALED 
 
Ordinance 2019-33 shall be repealed in its entirety and replaced with the provisions of this 
Ordinance. All other ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this 
Ordinance are hereby repealed. 
 
SECTION 3: SEVERABILITY 
 
If any provision of this Ordinance is held to be invalid or unenforceable for any reason, such 
holding shall not in any way affect the remaining portions hereof, which shall remain in full force 
and effect. 
 
SECTION 4: EFFECTIVE DATE 
 
This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after the date of its approval by the City 
Council of Daphne and publication as required by law. 
 
 ADOPTED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
DAPHNE THIS         DAY OF                 2026. 
 
 
 
 
              
        Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
         
 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
      
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk 

Page 126 of 135



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE NO: 2026-22 

 
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 2019-25, AS PREVIOUSLY 

AMENDED BY ORDINANCE NO. 2021-51, RELATING TO THE ADOPTION OF 
CERTAIN TECHNICAL CODES BY REFERENCE 

 
 WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Daphne (the “City”) desires to promote the 
health, safety, and welfare of the citizens of the City by establishing uniform rules and regulations 
for the construction, alteration, repair, use, and occupancy of buildings and structures within the 
City; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council previously adopted certain technical codes by reference 
pursuant to Ordinance No. 2019-25, as amended by Ordinance No. 2021-51; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the International Code Council and other applicable code organizations have 
adopted updated editions of certain technical codes; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that it is in the best interest of the City to 
adopt the most current editions of such technical codes and to revise certain local amendments and 
supplemental requirements applicable within the City; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council desires to amend Ordinance No. 2019-25 to adopt updated 
technical codes and local amendments while leaving the Building Permit Fee Schedule and Re-
Inspection Fees adopted pursuant to Ordinance No. 2021-51 unchanged; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA AS FOLLOWS: 
 
SECTION 1:   AMENDMENT OF SECTION I OF ORDINANCE NO. 2019-25 
 Section I of Ordinance No. 2019-25, entitled “Technical Codes Adopted by Reference,” is 
hereby repealed in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
 
SECTION 1: TECHNICAL CODES ADOPTED BY REFERENCE 

(a) For the purpose of establishing uniform rules and regulations governing the construction, 
alteration, repair, use, and occupancy of buildings and structures within the City of 
Daphne, the City Council hereby adopts by reference, from the date this Ordinance 
becomes effective, the provisions thereof and subsequent amendments thereto as 
permitted by law, the following technical codes: 

1. International Building Code, 2024 Edition, with amendments; 
2. International Residential Code, 2024 Edition, with amendments; 
3. International Mechanical Code, 2024 Edition; 
4. International Plumbing Code, 2024 Edition, with amendments; 
5. International Fuel Gas Code, 2024 Edition; 
6. International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2024 Edition; 

Page 127 of 135



2 
 

7. International Energy Conservation Code, 2015 Edition, as adopted and amended by 
the State of Alabama; 

8. International Wildland-Urban Interface Code, 2024 Edition; 
9. National Electrical Code, 2023 Edition, with amendments; and 
10. City of Daphne Supplemental Code and Local Amendments, attached hereto as 

Appendix A and incorporated herein by reference. 
  
(b) The above-referenced technical codes are hereby adopted as the Building Code of the City 

of Daphne and shall govern the construction, alteration, repair, use, and occupancy of 
buildings and structures within the corporate limits of the City of Daphne. 

(c) Copies of the above-referenced technical codes shall be maintained in the office of the 
City Clerk as required by law. 

 
SECTION II:  REPLACEMENT OF APPENDIX A 
 Appendix A to Ordinance No. 2019-25, entitled “City of Daphne Supplemental Code and 
Local Amendments,” is hereby repealed in its entirety and replaced with the document attached 
hereto as Appendix A, entitled “City of Daphne Supplemental Code and Local Amendments to 
the 2024 International Code Cycle.” 
 The Appendix A attached to and made a part of this Ordinance shall constitute the official 
local amendments, supplemental requirements, and administrative provisions applicable to the 
technical codes adopted by the City of Daphne pursuant to Section I of Ordinance No. 2019-25, 
as amended. 
 In the event of a conflict between the provisions of the technical codes adopted by reference 
and the provisions of Appendix A, the provisions of Appendix A shall control to the extent 
permitted by law. 
 
SECTION III:   CONTINUING EFFECT OF EXISTING FEE PROVISIONS AND  
   OTHER PROVISIONS 
 The Building Permit Fee Schedule, Re-Inspection Fees, Building Valuation Data Table, 
and all other fee-related provisions adopted pursuant to Ordinance No. 2021-51 shall remain 
unchanged and in full force and effect. Except as expressly amended by this Ordinance, all 
provisions of Ordinance No. 2019-25, as amended by Ordinance No. 2021-51, shall remain in full 
force and effect. 
 
SECTION IV: REPEALER 
 Any Ordinance heretofore adopted by the Council, which is in conflict with this Ordinance 
is hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict. 

 
SECTION VI:   SEVERABILITY 
 The provisions of this Ordinance are severable. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, 
phrase, or portion of this ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court 
of competent jurisdiction, such portion shall be deemed a separate, distinct and independent 
provision and such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions hereof. 

Page 128 of 135



3 
 

SECTION VII:  EFFECTIVE DATE AND TRANSITION 
 This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon its adoption and publication as 
required by law.  Notwithstanding the foregoing, for a period of one hundred eighty (180) days 
following the effective date of this Ordinance, the Building Official may accept permit applications 
and construction documents prepared in compliance with the technical codes previously adopted 
by the City prior to the adoption of this Ordinance. 
 Permit applications submitted during such transition period may be reviewed and approved 
under the previously adopted codes, provided the application is complete and complies with all 
other applicable requirements. Upon expiration of the transition period, all permit applications 
shall comply with the technical codes and amendments adopted by this Ordinance. 
 The Building Official is authorized to establish reasonable administrative procedures for 
implementation of this transition period and to resolve conflicts arising from projects designed 
under the previously adopted codes. 
 
 
 APPROVED AND ADOPTED THIS ____ DAY OF ___________, 2026. 
 
 
                                                                ________________________________ 
                                                                Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
                                                                
ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk  

Page 129 of 135



4 
 

APPENDIX A 
CITY OF DAPHNE  

LOCAL CODE AMENDMENTS AND SUPPLEMENTAL REQUIREMENTS 
 

Local Code Amendments 
 

2024 International Building Code (IBC): 

1. Amend Section 104.7 (Official records) to state: “The building official shall keep official 
records as required by Sections 104.7.1 through 104.7.5. Such official records shall be 
retained as per Alabama State Law.” 

2. Amend Section 1202.3 (Unvented attic and unvented enclosed rafter assemblies) to 
remove Condition 5.2 in its entirety. 

3. Amend Section 1609.3 (Basic design wind speed) to state: “The basic wind speed, V, in 
mph, for the determination of the wind loads shall be determined by the ASCE Hazard 
Tool website https://ascehazardtool.org/.” 

4. Amend Section 2402.1 (Glazing Replacement. General) to state: “The installation of 
replacement glass shall meet or exceed the ratings of the existing glass being replaced.” 

5. Amend Section 2902.1 (Minimum number of fixtures) to include, “Minimum fixture 
requirements may be altered upon approval of the Building Official”. 

6. Amend Section 2902.2 (Separate facilities) to remove Exception 5 and Exception 6 in their 
entirety. 

7. Adopt Appendix P, Sleeping Lofts 
 
2024 International Residential Code (IRC): 

1. Amend Section R104.7 (Official records) to state: “The building official shall keep official 
records as required by Sections R104.7.1 through R104.7.5. Such official records shall be 
retained as per Alabama State Law.” 

2. Amend Section 105.2 (Work Exempt from Permit) Exemption 1 to replace “200 square feet 
(18.52 m2) with “400 square feet (37.04 m2)”. 

3. Amend Section 105.2 (Work Exempt from Permit) Exemption 2 to state: “Fences made of 
chain-link, wrought iron, wood, or other similar material that is less than 7 feet tall.” 

4. Amend Section 105.2 (Work Exempt from Permit) Exemption 10 to replace “200 square 
feet (18.52 m2) with “400 square feet (37.04 m2)”. 

5. Amend Section R301.2.1 (Wind design criteria) to state: “Buildings and portions thereof 
shall be constructed in accordance with the wind provisions of this code using the ASCE 
Hazard Tool website https://ascehazardtool.org/.” 

6. Remove Section R309.2 (Automatic Sprinkler Systems) in its entirety. 

Page 130 of 135

https://ascehazardtool.org/
https://ascehazardtool.org/


5 
 

7. Amend Section P2503.4 (Building sewer testing) to replace “10-foot (3048 mm) head of 
water” with “5-foot (1524 mm) head of water”. 

8. Amend Section P2503.5.1 (Rough plumbing) item 1 (Water test) to replace “not less than 
10-feet (3048 mm) above highest fitting connection” with “not less than 5-feet (1524 mm) 
above highest fitting connection”. 

9. Remove Section P2503.6 (Shower liner test) in its entirety. 

10. Remove Section E3901.4.2 (Island and peninsular countertops and work surfaces) and 
Section E3901.4.3 (Receptacle outlet location) in their entirety and replace with the 
requirements of the 2018 International Residential Code (IRC) Sections E3901.4.2 (Island 
countertop spaces), E3901.4.3 (Peninsular countertop space), and E3901.4.5 (Receptacle 
outlet location). 

11. Amend Section E3902.12 (Specific appliance outlet) to remove item 5,6,7 and 8. 

12. Amend Section E3902.14 (Outdoor outlets) to remove the following sentence from 
Exception 3: “This exception shall expire September 1, 2026. [210.8(F)]” 

13. Adopt Appendix BB, Tiny Houses  

14. Adopt Appendix BD, Home Day Care Occupancy 

15. Adopt Appendix BF, Patio Covers 
 
2024 International Plumbing Code (IPC):  

1. Amend Section 312.2 (Drainage and vent water test) to replace all sections that state “10-
foot (3048 mm) head of water” or “10-feet (3048 mm) head of water” with “5-foot (1524 
mm) head of water” or “5-feet (1524 mm) head of water”. 

2. Remove Section 312.10 (Shower liner test) in its entirety.  

3. Amend Section 403.1 (Minimum number of fixtures) to include, “Minimum fixture 
requirements may be altered upon approval of the Building Official”. 

4. Amend Section 403.2 (Separate facilities) to remove Exception 5 and Exception 6 in their 
entirety.  

 
2023 National Electrical Code (NEC):  

1. Amend Section 210.8(D) (Specific appliance) to remove items 1,4,8,9, and 11. 

2. Remove Section 210.52(C)(2) (Island and Peninsular Countertops and Work Surfaces) in 
its entirety and replace with the requirements of the 2017 National Electrical Code (NEC) 
Section 210.52(C)(2) (Island Countertop Spaces). 

3. Amend Section 210.8(F) (Outdoor outlets) to remove the following sentence from 
Exception 2: “This exception shall expire September 1, 2026.” 

Page 131 of 135



6 
 

Supplemental Requirements 
 

 The provisions of these modifications are intended to complement the locally adopted 
codes and amendments. The elements of design not addressed by the provisions of these 
modifications shall be in accordance with the locally adopted codes. 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE 

1. Submittal documents- Construction documents, special inspections, structural observation 
program, test results, receipts and all other data shall be submitted digitally through the 
online permitting poral. 

2. The basic wind speed, V, in mph, for the determination of the wind loads shall be 
determined by the ASCE Hazard Tool website https://ascehazardtool.org/. 

3. All Residential rough-in inspections (framing, mechanical, electrical, and plumbing) shall 
be scheduled as a 4-way inspection by the contractor responsible for construction. Email 
all inspection request to Buildinginspections@Daphneal.com 

 
STRUCTURAL 

1. All new construction and alterations shall require structural plans that have been prepared, 
signed, dated, and stamped by a design professional who is licensed by the State of 
Alabama. 

2. Trusses manufactured in states other than Alabama may be approved at the Building 
Official’s discretion. 

3. Windows must have a minimum rating of DP50 or PG50 unless approved by the engineer 
of record and Building Official. 

4. The installation of replacement doors, windows, or glass must meet or exceed the existing 
performance ratings. 

5. Engineered plans for non-habitable residential accessory structures may not be required at 
the Building Official’s discretion. 

6. Any structural design that integrates into an existing habitable residential structure (such 
as roof decking, rafters, trusses, or top plate) shall require structural plans that have been 
prepared, signed, dated, and stamped by a design professional who is licensed by the State 
of Alabama. 

7. When insulation is required underneath a conditioned space to complete the structure’s 
thermal envelope, closed cell foam or other approved methods shall be required. 

 

 

Page 132 of 135

https://ascehazardtool.org/
mailto:Buildinginspections@daphneal.com


7 
 

ROOF COVERINGS 

ASPHALT SHINGLES – REQUIREMENTS 
Wind Speed Shingle Testing Standard/Classification 

130 mph or greater ASTM D7158 Class H or ASTM D3161 Class F 
 

1. All roof coverings and underlayment shall be removed (exception #9 and #10 below and 
exceptions from 2024 IRC Section 908.3) and any roof decking attached with staples or 
nailing pattern less than 6 inches on center (OC) edge and 6 inches OC intermediate shall 
be re‐nailed with #8D ring shank nails to meet 6 inches OC edge and intermediate. 

2. Asphalt shingles shall be installed according to the manufacturer’s installation instructions 
for High Wind Areas with a minimum of 6 nails. 

3. All asphalt shingle roof covering underlayment shall be of a synthetic tear resistant 
polypropylene, polyester or fiberglass fabric certified by an approved testing agency or 
ICC‐ES report. The Building Official may approve an equal or higher performing product. 
Asphalt felt roofing underlayment shall not be installed as a roof covering underlayment. 

• Roof underlayment shall be installed and fastened in accordance with the 
manufacturer’s installation instructions. 

• NOTE: Most manufacturers do not allow staples as an approved fastener or staple 
button caps 

4. All aluminum/vinyl soffit covering shall be attached to minimum 7/16 OSB or plywood or 
minimum 2x2 wood supports 8-inch OC maximum. 

5. Metal roof covering shall be installed per manufacturer’s installation instructions for High 
Wind Zone minimum fastening requirements: Metal roof covering shall be fastened to roof 
assembly with a maximum 2-foot OC spacing of fasteners in the length dimensions of the 
panels. The minimum number of fasteners in width dimension of the panel shall be no less 
than 4 inches. 

6. 1x4 or 2x4 wood purlins for attachment of metal roof coverings shall be a maximum of 2 
feet OC. Wood purlins shall be nailed with a minimum of 2 deformed (i.e., spiral or ring 
shank) #16D nails into existing rafters at maximum of 24 inches OC. 

7. Roof decks shall be nailed in accordance with the engineered drawings but no less than 6 
inches OC maximum intermediate and edge, with minimum #8D irregular shank (i.e., ring 
shank or spiral) nails with full round heads. Staples are not permitted for fastening of the 
roof decking. 

8. Roof deck seams shall be taped with a minimum 4-inch peel and stick tape meeting ASTM 
D‐1970 or entire roof deck covered and sealed with peel and stick underlayment meeting 
ASTM D‐1970 or closed cell foam meeting ASTM D‐1622 may be applied underneath to 
each side of framing member and sheathing seams to achieve a sealed roof deck. Other 

Page 133 of 135



8 
 

equal or greater methods may be approved by the Building Official. 

9. Unfinished and temporary roof coverings shall not be allowed for more than 60 days 
without approval from the Building Official. 

ENERGY 

1. Attic: minimum insulation      R-38 Wall: minimum insulation R-13    Floor: minimum 
insulation R-13 

2. Batt insulation shall be cut neatly to fit around pipes and wires or be placed behind piping 
and wiring. Must staple securely to the face of the stud. 

3. Air permeable insulation shall not be used as a sealing material. 
4. Space between windows and door jams shall be sealed. 
5. Corners, headers and sill plates shall be sealed. 
6. Rim joist shall be insulated. 
7. A continuous air barrier shall be installed in the building envelope. All breaks, joints and 

penetrations in the air barrier shall be sealed as per manufacturer instructions. 
8. Access openings to un-conditioned spaces shall be insulated and sealed (weather stripping/ 

gasket). 
9. Building cavities shall not be used as ducts or plenums. 
10. Programmable thermostats shall be installed. 
11. A minimum of 75% of the lights used shall be of high efficiency. 
12. Recessed lighting fixtures shall be sealed to be airtight. 
13. U factor of 40 and SHGC of .25 minimum for windows. 
14. At the time of rough inspection all penetrations to unconditioned areas must be sealed with 

caulking or expandable foam.  
 
PLUMBING 

1. Pex supply piping shall be inspected at a minimum pressure of 75 psi. 
2. Copper and CPVC piping systems shall be inspected at street pressure or greater. 
3. All bathtubs and showers shall be connected to the drain waste and vent system at time of 

top out inspection. Exception: Whirlpool and Garden tubs may be installed after top out 
inspection. The trap servicing the Whirlpool and Garden tub shall be installed at the time 
of inspection. 

 
ELECTRICAL 

1. All receptacles shall be supplied by a minimum #12 AWG and protected by a 20 Amp 
Circuit Breaker. 

Page 134 of 135



9 
 

2. General Lighting, Smoke/Carbon Monoxide Alarms shall be allowed to be supplied by a 
minimum #14 AWG and protected by a 15 Amp Circuit Breaker. 

FUEL GAS 
 

1. Fuel Gas shall meet all requirement set forth by Daphne Utilities and the 2024 International 
Fuel Gas (IFC) code. 

2. All Fuel Gas installations from the consumer side of the meter to the point of use shall be 
inspected by The City of Daphne and Daphne. 

 
MODULAR HOMES 

1. Plans stamped by the Alabama Manufactured Home Commission (AMHC) shall be 
required. 

2. Modular Homes shall be certified by an Alabama Registered Engineer to meet adopted 
wind loads. 

3. Foundation and/or anchorage plans are required and must be prepared, signed, dated, and 
stamped by a design professional who is licensed by the State of Alabama. 

4. Modular Homes shall be installed as per the engineered installation instructions. 

5. Modular Home installations require a Building permit and Electrical permit. 

6. Modular Homes shall be required to have an Electrical service inspection prior to 
establishing electricity and a Final Building inspection prior to occupancy. Underground 
water, sewer and electrical conduit trenches must be inspected prior to covering. 

7. In factory construction and components are not the responsibility of the City of Daphne 
Building Inspection Department. 

 
 
 

[End of Appendix A] 
 
 
                                            

Page 135 of 135


	1. CALL TO ORDER
	A. ROLL CALL
	B. INVOCATION by Reverend Thack Dyson, St. Paul's Epi
	C. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

	2. PROCLAMATIONS/RECOGNITIONS/PUBLIC HEARINGS
	A. CERTIFICATE OF APPRECIATION to Herb Cole for his s
	Herb Cole Recognition

	B. PROCLAMATION recognizing Dr. John McMahon, Medical
	John McMahon Proclamation_June 2026

	C. PROCLAMATION recognizing Houston Sanders for his s
	Houston Sanders Retirement_July 2026

	D. PUBLIC HEARING: Ordinance Ratifying, Confirming, a
	Ordinance 2026-18 - ANNEX - Allegri Volovecky


	3. APPROVE MINUTES
	A. June 1, 2026, regular meeting
	06-01-2026 Council Minutes


	4. REPORTS OF STANDING COMMITTEES
	A. FINANCE COMMITTEE - Conaway
	B. BUILDINGS & PROPERTY COMMITTEE- Messinger     Revi
	i. Review the minutes from the May 11, 2026, meeting
	05-11-2026 - Buildings and Property Committee Meeting

	May 2026 Comparison Report

	C. PUBLIC SAFETY COMMITTEE - Green
	i. Review the minutes from the May 11, 2026, meeting
	PS May 2026 minutes


	D. CODE ENFORCEMENT/ORDINANCE COMMITTEE - Roberts
	E. PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE - Coleman

	5. REPORTS OF SPECIAL BOARDS & COMMISSIONS
	A. BOARD OF ZONING ADJUSTMENTS - Adrienne Jones
	B. DAPHNE PUBLIC SCHOOL COMMISSION - Messinger
	C. DOWNTOWN REDEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY - Olen
	D. INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT BOARD - Coleman
	E. LIBRARY BOARD - Olen
	F. PLANNING COMMISSION - Olen
	i. Review of the minutes from the regular meeting of 
	Planning Commission Report and Minutes 0603
	Prezoning and Annexation Request for Conaway.PC recommendation
	Rezoning Request for DAK Investments.PC recommendation


	G. RECREATION BOARD - Green
	H. UTILITY BOARD - Coleman
	i. Review the minutes from the April 29, 2026, meetin
	APPROVED April 29 2026 DU Minutes



	6. PUBLIC PARTICIPATION
	7. MAYOR’S REPORT
	8. CITY ATTORNEY REPORT
	9. DEPARTMENT HEAD REPORTS
	10. CITY CLERK’S REPORT
	A. MOTION to approve the publication and set a public
	James A Conaway Trust Dated June 17 2010 PreZone Amend

	B. MOTION to approve the publication and set a public
	James A Conaway Trust Dated June 17 2010 Annex Petition

	C. MOTION to approve the publication and set a public
	DAK Investments LLC Rezone Amend

	D. MOTION to approve the ​Ballin' on Belrose Run/Walk
	Ballin on Belrose Event Permit Application


	11. RESOLUTIONS
	12. 2nd READ ORDINANCES
	A. 2026-17 - Zoning District Map - Revisions to the C
	Ordinance 2026-17 - REVISIONS TO ZONING MAP June 2026

	B. 2026-18 - Ordinance Ratifying, Confirming, and Rea
	Ordinance 2026-18 - ANNEX - Allegri Volovecky


	13. 1st READ ORDINANCES
	A. 2026-19 - Ordinance Amending the City of Daphne's 
	Ordinance 2026-19 - Garbage Collection Ordinance Amendments

	B. 2026-20 - Ordinance Establishing a Temporary Morat
	Ordinance 2026-20 - Multi-Family Moratorium Ordinance

	C. 2026-21 - Ordinance to Repeal Ordinance No. 2019-3
	Ordinance 2026-21 - Daphne Fire Ordinance

	D. 2026-22 - Ordinance Amending Ordinance No 2019-25,
	Ordinance 2026-22 - Building Code - Amend 2019-25


	14. COUNCIL COMMENTS
	15. ADJOURN



