
 

CODE ENFORCEMENT/ORDINANCE 

COMMITTEE 
REGULAR MEETING AGENDA  

1705 MAIN STREET, DAPHNE, AL 

MONDAY, JUNE 1, 2026 at 4:30 PM  

Councilman Benjamin Hughes Councilwoman Tommie Conaway 

Councilwoman Jennifer Green Councilman Joel Coleman 

Councilman Steve Olen Councilwoman Stephanie Messinger 

Councilman Oliver Roberts, Chairperson  
 

1. CALL TO ORDER/ROLL CALL 
 

2. APPROVE MINUTES 
 

  A. Review the minutes from the May 4, 2026, meeting 
 

3. PUBLIC PARTICIPATION 
 

4. ORDINANCE REVIEW/DISCUSSION 
 

  A. Fire Code Adoption 
 

  B. Solid Waste Ordinance Review 
 

  C. Multi-Family Residential Development Moratorium Ordinance 
 

  D. Business License Discussion 
 

5. OTHER BUSINESS DEEMED NECESSARY 
 

6. NEXT MEETING: July 6, 2026 
 

7. ADJOURN 
 

 

Page 1 of 105



CODE ENFORCEMENT/ORDINANCE COMMITTEE MEETING 
May 4, 2026, 4:30 p.m. 

City Hall, Council Chamber 
1705 Main Street, Daphne, AL 36526 

 

MEETING MINUTES    

MEMBERS PRESENT:    Councilman Coleman, Councilman Roberts, Councilwoman Messinger, 
Councilwoman Green and Councilman Hughes 

MEMBERS ABSENT:  Councilwoman Conaway and Councilman Olen 

ALSO PRESENT:  Patrick Dungan, City Attorney; Christina Brazell, Code Enforcement; Mayor LeJeune; Cindy 
Beaudreau, City Clerk; Troy Strunk, City Development; Bobby Purvis, Public Works; Chief Tacon, Fire; Kelli 
Reid, Finance; Connie Chapman, Revenue; Randy Jones, Solid Waste; Ben Davis, Recreation; Emma Coleman, 
Junior Councilmember; Lakyn Coggin, Junior City Council; and Jessica Linne, Assistant City Clerk.  

1) CALL MEETING TO ORDER / ROLL CALL 

There being a quorum present Councilman Roberts called the meeting to order at 4:31 p.m. 

2) APPROVE MINUTES FROM THE April 6, 2026 Meeting 

3)          PUBLIC PARTICIPATION 

Gilberto Colon, Havenwood Circle, proposed new stop signs in Lake Forest and will present his proposal at the 
Public Safety meeting. 

4) ORDINANCE REVIEW/DISCUSSION  

A) Revisions to the Park Ordinance 

Ben Davis, Recreation, presented the revised Park Ordinance which was amended to include a new section stating 
that no person, firm, or entity shall conduct or engage in any commercial activity within any City park or 
recreational facility except with the prior written approval of the City. 

 

MOTION by Councilman Hughes to recommend to Council to approve the Revised Park 
Ordinance. Seconded by Councilwoman Green. 

MOTION CARRIED UNANIMOUSLY.  
 

 B) Business License Discussion 

Councilwoman Messinger shared an issue that was brought to her attention regarding the 24-hour grace period for 
unlicensed workers and suggested a cease and desist along with a ticket. 

Rene Pollet, Pro One Painters, shared his experience with Code Enforcement, the removal of signs in his 
neighborhood and his frustration with the 24-hour grace period. Mr. Pollet offered his time to the city to help find 
a solution. 

Discussion continued related to the varying grace periods for different types of work, protecting customers and 
businesses and the different types of jobs requiring permits and worker’s comp. 

This topic will be added to next month’s meeting for further discussion. 

 

 

Page 2 of 105



5)        OTHER BUSINESS DEEMED NECESSARY  

6)        NEXT MEETING 

The next meeting is scheduled for Monday, June 1, 2026 at 4:30 p.m. 
 
7)  ADJOURN 

There being no further business to discuss, the Council adjourned at 5:04pm.  

Page 3 of 105



1 

 

CITY OF DAPHNE 

ORDINANCE 2019-33 

 

FIRE PREVENTION CODE FOR THE CITY OF DAPHNE 

 

AN ORDINANCE TO REPEAL ORDINANCE NO. 2012-41 AND ADOPT THE 2018 

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS THERETO FOR THE CITY OF 

DAPHNE, ALABAMA. 

 

 WHEREAS, the 20182024 edition of the International Fire Code including Appendix 

Chapters A, B, C, D, E, F, H, I and N copyrighted by the International Code Council, with 

amendments thereto, has heretofore been on file in the Office of the City Clerk of the City of 

Daphne, Alabama; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Daphne has determined that it is in the best 

interest of the health, safety, and welfare of its citizens to adopt the 20182024 edition of the 

International Fire Code, as amended herein. 

   

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 

OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA AS FOLLOWS: 

 

SECTION 1.  ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, EDITION 2018 

 

A. 

Section 101.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

101.1 Title.    These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of Daphne, The City of Daphne 

hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 

 

B. 

Section 103.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

103.1 General.    

 

Bureau of Fire Prevention.  There is hereby established a department to be called the 

Bureau of Fire Prevention and the person in charge shall be known in this Code as the Fire 

Code Official, who shall be the Fire Marshal of the City of Daphne. The function of the 

department shall be the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions 

of this code and amendments.  

 

Creation of Agency  

 

The City of Daphne Bureau of Fire Prevention is hereby created and the person in charge 

shall be known in this Code as the Fire Code Official, who shall be the Fire Marshal of the 

City of Daphne. The function of the department shall be the implementation, administration 

and enforcement of the provisions of this code and amendments. 

 

 

Page 4 of 105



2 

 

C. 

Section 103.2 Appointment of the Fire Code Official shall be deleted in its entirety. 

 

D. 

Section 105.6.32 105.5.36 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

105.6.32 105.5.36 Open Burning 

 

No person shall kindle or maintain any bonfire or rubbish fire or authorize any such fire to 

be kindled or maintained without a permit or other proper authorization. 

 

No waste materials, rubbish, trees, bushes or brush cleared for construction or demolition 

of buildings or structures shall be disposed of by burning on the premises or in the 

immediate vicinity by the owner, the contractor, or any other person, unless a permit or 

other proper authorization has been obtained to burn said waste materials in an approved 

waste burner/incinerator.       

 

 

The permit for each approved waste burner/incinerator shall be $75.00. 

 

E. 

Section 105.7.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

105.7.1 Fixed Fire Extinguishing Systems Installation 

 

No person shall engage in the business of installing fixed fire extinguishing systems 

without obtaining a permit from the Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

 

No person shall install a fixed fire extinguishing system without obtaining a current City 

of Daphne business license. 

 

No person shall be issued a permit to install fixed fire extinguishing equipment who does 

not possess a manufacturers certification for installation and servicing for the type system 

being installed and have a Certificate of Insurance, General Liability for $ 1,000,000 with 

the City of Daphne, Bureau of Fire Prevention, P.O. Box 400, Daphne AL. 36526 listed as 

a Certificate Holder. 

 

Any modifications made to a fixed system including adding additional flow points will 

require an installation permit. 

A complete plan/drawing of the system and the devices that are being protected shall be 

submitted before a permit is issued and a copy shall be placed in the control box.   

 

The technician who actually performs the installation of the fixed fire extinguishing 

systems shall legibly sign and date the service tag verifying that all work was done in 

compliance with current NFPA standards. 

The Fire Code Official shall require certain operational tests upon final inspection. 

 

 

Page 5 of 105



3 

 

Section 105.1.2.2 insert “Unauthorized work 

1) Where work for which a permit is required by this code commences prior to obtaining 

said permit, the permit fee herein specified shall be doubled plus $100.” 

 

 

E.1. 

Section 105.7.1.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

105.7.1.1 Servicing Fixed Fire Extinguishing Systems 

 

No person shall engage in the business of servicing or inspecting fixed fire extinguishing 

systems without obtaining a permit from the Bureau of Fire Prevention. The permit is good 

only for that calendar year in which it is issued. 

 

No person shall service or inspect a fixed fire extinguishing system without obtaining a 

current City of Daphne business license. 

 

No person shall be issued a permit to service or inspect fixed fire extinguishing equipment 

who does not possess a manufacturers certification for installation and servicing for the 

type system being installed and have a Certificate of Insurance, General Liability for $ 

1,000,000 with the City of Daphne, Bureau of Fire Prevention, P.O. Box 400, Daphne AL. 

36526 listed as a Certificate Holder. 

   

Any modifications made to a fixed system including adding additional flow points will 

require an installation permit. 

   

A complete plan/drawing of the system and the devices that are being protected shall be 

submitted before a permit is issued and a copy shall be placed in the control box.   

 

The technician who actually performs the work of servicing or inspecting the fixed fire 

extinguishing systems shall legibly sign and date the service tag verifying that all work was 

done in compliance with current NFPA standards. 

 

A permit is not required for follow up inspection or service, if a permit was received for 

that system in the same year.  However a report shall be furnished to the Bureau of Fire 

Prevention upon completion of work being done. 

 

The permit fee for servicing a fixed fire extinguisher system shall be $75.00. 

 

F. 

Section 105.7.7 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

105.7.7 Fire Alarm System Installation 

 

No person shall install a fire alarm system without having the plans stamped by a licensed 

Engineer and reviewed by the Fire Code Official before commencing any part of the work. 

No person shall commence working on a fire alarm system without first obtaining a permit 

from the Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

Page 6 of 105



4 

 

 

Stamped drawings from a licensed Engineer are required for any additions to an existing 

system. 

There is accepted from the requirements of this Section installations in any building with 

single station detectors only. 

 

Installer must possess a State Fire Alarm Permit issued by the State Fire Marshal’s office. 

 

Any person or entity who designs fire alarm systems must possess a State Fire Alarm 

Permit issued by the State Fire Marshal’s office. 

    

Licensed electricians may pull wire, mount ancillary equipment, and connect the main 

power to the control panel after a permit has been issued; but no one other than a qualified 

fire alarm installer shall be allowed to make any other connections inside the control panel. 

    

Multi-Tenant Buildings.  In multi-tenant buildings requiring automatic fire sprinkler 

systems, and where no fire alarm is required by Section 907, each tenant shall have at least 

one notification device (horn/strobe) to provide audible and visual notification upon 

activation of the listed sprinkler monitoring system. 

 

Any multiple-family residential development that has a fire sprinkler system shall have a 

horn/strobe device located on the front side of the building visible from the roadway. 

 

A certified fire sprinkler installer may install devices integral to the operation of the fire 

sprinkler system, but shall not make and connections to the fire alarm system. 

    

Upon final inspection, the NFPA Fire Alarm System Record of Completion form must be 

properly filled out and submitted to the Fire Code Official and a fire alarm system test must 

be performed in the presence of the Fire Code Official. 

 

All fire alarm circuit disconnecting means shall have a red marking and shall be identified 

as “Fire Alarm”. 

  

Fire Alarm Control Units (FACU) will be located at the entrance of the building or provide 

an annunciator panel at the entrance and also indicate the location of the main panel. 

    

The permit fee for installing a fire alarm system shall be $75.00. 

 

F.1. 

Section 105.7.7.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

105.7.7.1 Servicing Fire Alarm Systems 

      

No person shall engage in the business of servicing fire alarm systems without obtaining a 

permit from the Fire Code Official. The permit is good only for that calendar year of which 

it is issued. There is exception from the requirements of Section 105.7.7.1 installations of 

the following types: 

 

Page 7 of 105



5 

 

(1) One and two family dwellings 

(2) Any buildings with single station detectors only. 

 

(3) Owners of buildings may maintain their own systems as long as their maintenance 

person is certified by the manufacturer of the installed equipment or has National 

Institute for Certification in Engineering Technologies (NICET) level II in fire 

alarms. 

 

No person shall be issued a permit to modify, repair, test or service fire alarm systems who 

does not possess a State of Alabama Fire Alarm Permit issued by the State Fire Marshal’s 

office. 

            

A service tag or sticker shall be required to be installed by the permitted alarm servicing 

individual or company at the control panel of each fire alarm system, stating the company’s 

name, address, phone number, name of the technician performing the service, date and the 

type of service performed.  

 

The permit fee to service a fire alarm system shall be $75.00. 

 

G. 

Section 105.7.8 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

105.7.8 Fire Pumps Installation 

 

Any person who installs fire pumps must be licensed by the Alabama State Fire Marshal’s 

Office and approved by the Fire Code Official. 

 

No person shall install a fire pump without first obtaining a permit from the Bureau of Fire 

Prevention. 

 

Installer must possess a current City of Daphne business license and have a Certificate of 

Insurance, General Liability for $1,000,000 with the City of Daphne, Bureau of Fire 

Prevention, P.O. Box 400, Daphne AL. 36526 listed as a Certificate Holder. 

 

Installer must have fire pump plans reviewed by the Fire Code Official before commencing 

installation. 

 

All testing of the fire pump shall comply with NFPA 25. The Fire Code Official may 

require certain operational test upon final inspection. 

 

The permit fee to install a fire pump shall be $75.00. 

 

G.1. 

Section 105.7.8.1 shall be added to read as follows: 

    

105.7.8.1 Servicing Fire Pumps 

 

Page 8 of 105



6 

 

Any person who services, test or inspects fire pumps must be licensed by the Alabama 

State Fire Marshal’s Office and approved by the Fire Code Official. 

No person shall service, test or inspect a fire pump without first obtaining a permit from 

the Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

 

The Person/Business who obtains the permit must possess a current City of Daphne 

business license and have a Certificate of Insurance, General Liability for $1,000,000 with 

the City of Daphne, Bureau of Fire Prevention, P.O. Box 400, Daphne AL. 36526 listed as 

a Certificate Holder 

 

The permit fee to service, test or inspect a fire pump shall be $75.00. 

 

H. 

Section 105.7.26 shall be added to read as follows:    

   

105.7.26 Portable Fire Extinguisher Service 

 

No person shall engage in the business of servicing portable fire extinguishers without 

obtaining a permit from the Bureau of Fire Prevention. The permit is good only for that 

calendar year of which it is issued. 

 

No person shall service portable fire extinguishers without obtaining a current City of 

Daphne business license. 

  

No person shall be issued a permit to service a portable fire extinguisher that does not 

possess a manufactures service manual for the type of extinguisher being serviced, and 

have the proper training. They shall have a Certificate of Insurance, General Liability for 

$1,000,000 with the City of Daphne, Bureau of Fire Prevention, P.O. Box 400 Daphne, AL 

36526 listed as a Certificate Holder.  

 

The technician who actually performs the work of servicing the portable fire extinguishers 

shall legibly sign and date the service tag verifying that all work was done in compliance 

with current NFPA standards. 

 

The annual permit fee for portable fire extinguisher service shall be $75.00. 

 

I. 

Section 105.7.27 shall be added to read as follows: 

 

105.7.27 Install Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems 

     

No person shall install, modify or repair an automatic fire sprinkler system without 

obtaining a permit from the Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

 

Any person who installs or maintains fire sprinkler systems (hereinafter called in Section 

402.35 “installer”) must be certified by the Alabama State Fire Marshal’s Office, and have 

a Certificate of Insurance, General Liability for $1,000,000 with the City of Daphne,  

 

Page 9 of 105



7 

 

Bureau of Fire Prevention, P.O. Box 400, Daphne AL. 36526 listed as a Certificate Holder. 

 

Installer must possess a current City of Daphne business license. 

 

Installer must have sprinkler plans stamped by a licensed Engineer and must be reviewed 

by the Fire Code Official before commencing installation. 

     

Upon final inspection, the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Contractor's 

Material and Test Certificate for Aboveground Piping must be properly completed and 

submitted to the Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

 

The Fire Code Official shall be present during the final inspection of the sprinkler system. 

 

Relocating more than three (3) sprinkler heads or adding any heads in an existing fire 

sprinkler system shall require a permit from the Bureau of Fire Prevention and stamped 

drawings from an Engineer.  

 

The permit fee for each automatic fire sprinkler system installation                       shall 

be $75.00. 

 

I.1. 

Section 105.7.27.1 shall be added to read as follows: 

 

105.7.27.1 Servicing Fire Sprinkler Systems 

 

No person shall service or inspect an automatic fire sprinkler system without obtaining a 

permit from the Bureau of Fire Prevention. 

              

Any person who services or maintains fire sprinkler systems must be certified by the 

Alabama State Fire Marshal’s Office, and have a Certificate of Insurance, General Liability 

for $1,000,000 with the City of Daphne, Bureau of Fire Prevention, P.O. Box 400, Daphne 

AL. 36526 listed as a Certificate Holder. 

 

No person shall perform maintenance or testing on fire sprinkler systems unless said person 

is certified by the Alabama State Fire Marshal’s office and approved by the Fire Code 

Official. 

 

Installer must possess a current City of Daphne business license. 

    

The permit fee for servicing a fire sprinkler system shall be $75.00. 

 

The permit shall be valid only for the calendar year in which it is issued. 

 

J. 

Section 105.7.28 shall be added to read as follows: 

 

105.7.28 Additional Permits 

 

Page 10 of 105



8 

 

All permit requirements shall be followed. 

 

Where work for which a permit is required by this code commences prior to obtaining said 

permit, the permit fee herein specified shall be doubled plus $100. 

 

It shall be required that a copy of all annual or semi-annual inspection reports be submitted 

to the Bureau of Fire Prevention with any and all deficiencies clearly noted. 

 

All checks and money orders shall be made out to the City of Daphne. 

 

All certifications whether they are manufacture or NICET must be current and not have 

expired.  

 

General requirements for a permit are as follows: 

 

1. Current city of Daphne Business license. 

2. Current one million dollar ($1,000,000) general liability insurance policy with the 

City of Daphne listed as a certificate holder, P.O. Box 400 Daphne AL 36526.   

3. Approved by the Fire Code Official. 

4. Current Approved Training Certificates. 

5. Permit fee of $75.00 

 

K. 

Section 110.4 113.4 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

110.4 113.4 Violation penalties 

 

Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply with any of the 

requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, repairs, or does work in violation of the 

approved construction documents or any directive of the fire code official, or of a permit 

or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a Fire Code Violation, 

punishable by a fine as determined by the Municipal Court Judge or by imprisonment as 

determined by the Municipal Court Judge, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day 

that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate 

offense.  See Section 105.7.28 for applicable exceptions. 

 

K.1. 

Section 112.4 114.4 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

112.4 114.4 Failure to comply 

 

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, 

except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 

condition, shall be liable and subject to penalties as determined by the Municipal Court 

Judge. 

  

L. 

Section 307.2.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

Page 11 of 105



9 

 

 

307.2.1 Authorization 

 

Open burning shall only be allowed once a calendar month per address/ location during the 

months that outdoor burning is allowed by the State Air Quality Agencies. A permit must 

be obtained before any burning starts and all provisions of the burn permit shall be 

followed. 

 

M. 

 

Section 307.4.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

307.4.1 Bonfires 

 

A bonfire shall not be conducted within 50 feet (15 240 mm) of a structure or combustible 

material unless the fire is contained in a barbecue pit. Conditions which could cause a fire 

to spread within 50 feet (15 240 mm) of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition. 

Bonfire permits shall only be issued to organizations (Churches, Schools, and other Civic 

Groups) not to private individuals.  

 

N. 

Section 503.2.5 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

503.2.5 Dead ends 

 

Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet (45 720 mm) in length shall be 

provided with an approved area for turning around fire apparatus per the provisions in 

accordance with Appendix D, Table D103.1. and figure D103.4.  A Geo grid type material 

may be used for the turnaround but must be outlined along the edges of the area to be used. 

 

O. 

That portion of Section 505.1 of the International Fire Code that reads “Numbers shall be a 

minimum of 4 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inches” shall be struck and replaced 

with “numbers shall be a minimum of 5 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inches.” 

Section 505.1 shall be removed and replaced with the following: 

New and existing buildings shall be provided with approved address identification.  The address 

identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting 

the property.  Address identification characters shall contrast with their background.  Address 

numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters.  Numbers shall not be spelled out.  Each 

character shall be not less than 5 inches high with a maximum stroke width of ½ inch.  Where 

required by the fire code official, address identification shall e provided in additional approved 

locations to facilitate emergency response.  Where access is by means of a private road and the 

building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall be 

used to identify the structure.  Address identification shall be maintained. 

 

P. 

Section 506.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

  

Page 12 of 105



10 

 

506.1 Key boxes 

 

Key boxes shall be installed in all buildings having two or more units/suites, or having an 

automatic fire sprinkler system, fire alarm system or any alarm that generates a fire 

department response.  The Fire Code Official shall also have the authority to require a key 

box to be installed in an accessible location where access to or within a structure or area is 

difficult because of security. The key box shall be of and approved type and shall contain 

keys to gain necessary access as required by the Fire Code Official. 

 

 

 

P.1. 

Section 506.1.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

506.1.1 Locks 

 

An approved lock shall be installed on gates or similar barriers where required by the Fire 

Code Official.  If gate access is required by the Fire Code Official, it shall be by a key 

switch of an approved type. 

    

Q.  

Section 507.5.1.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

   

507.5.1.1 Hydrant for Fire Sprinkler Systems and Standpipe Systems 

 

Building equipped with a standpipe or fire sprinkler system installed in accordance with 

Chapter 9 shall have a fire hydrant within 100 feet of the FDC (fire department connection).  

 

R. 

Section 508.5.7 shall be added to read as follows: 

 

508.5.7 Hydrant Outlet Location  

 

Hydrants shall be installed with the center of the outlet cap nut at least 18 inches above the 

adjoining final grade. 

 

S.  

Section 901.2.1.1 add "All sprinkler and fire alarm design drawings submitted to the fire 

department for review shall abide by the Alabama State Board of Licensure for Professional 

Engineers and Land Surveyors' fire protection position statement. NICET certification does not 

replace the requirement for professional licensure. The designing of fire protection and detection 

systems is engineering and as such must be designed by or under the direct supervision of 

professional engineers qualified to design fire protection and detection systems. Only fire 

protection and detection designs that have been signed and sealed by a qualified Alabama licensed 

professional engineer shall be approved for construction." 

 

Section 901.2.1.2 insert “Contractor Qualification Requirements. Copies of applicable permits, 

certifications, current Daphne Business License and a current one million dollar ($1,000,000) 

Page 13 of 105



11 

 

general liability insurance policy with the City of Daphne listed as a certificate holder, P.O. Box 

400 Daphne AL 36526 shall be submitted to the Fire Marshal for review. 

 

1) Restaurant Fixed Extinguishing Systems: 

• The qualifier must possess manufacturer certification (which restricts them to that manufacturer) 

and/or NAFED/ICC 

certification (which would allow them to be unrestricted and service, maintain, or install any 

system). 

 

2) Sprinkler Systems: 

• Must possess a current sprinkler permit through the Alabama State Fire Marshal's Office and 

applicable NICET 

certification. 

 

3) Fire Alarm Systems: 

• Must possess a fire alarm permit through the Alabama State Fire Marshal's Office and applicable 

NICET certification. 

Must possess a minimum of NICET II to perform technician work, or work under the direct 

supervision of a NICET II. 

 

4) Portable Fire Extinguishers: 

• Current certificate of training on portable fire extinguishers in compliance with NFPA 10." 

 

 

 

Section 905.3.1 shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

905.3.1 Building height 

 

Class III standpipe systems shall be installed throughout buildings where the floor level of 

the highest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) above the lowest level of the fire 

department vehicle access, or where the floor level of the lowest story is located more than 

30 feet (9144 mm) below the highest level of fire department vehicle access. A class I, 

Manual Wet, standpipe system shall be installed in building where the floor level is of the 

highest story is located more than 20 feet above the lowest level of the fire department 

vehicle access. 

 

T. Appendices 

 

The following appendices to the International Fire Code, 2024 Edition, are hereby adopted as part 

of the Daphne Fire Code: 

 

 Appendix A, Board of Appeals 

Appendix B, Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution 

Appendix D, Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

Section D107.1 Shall be deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 

 

Page 14 of 105



12 

 

It is recommended that developments of one- or two-family dwellings where the number 

of dwelling units exceeds 30, be provided with two separate and approved fire apparatus 

access roads. 

Appendix E, Hazard Categories 

Appendix F, Hazard Ranking 

Appendix H, Hazardous Materials Management plan and Hazardous Materials Inventory     

Statement Instructions 

Appendix I, Fire Protection Systems-Noncompliant Conditions 

Appendix N, Indoor Trade Shows and Exhibitions 

 

SECTION 2: ORDINANCES REPEALED 
 

Ordinance 2012-41 2019-33 shall be repealed in its entirety and replaced with the provisions of 

this Ordinance. All other ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions of this 

Ordinance are hereby repealed. 

 

SECTION 3: SEVERABILITY 
 

If any provision of this Ordinance is held to be invalid or unenforceable for any reason, such 

holding shall not in any way affect the remaining portions hereof, which shall remain in full force 

and effect. 

 

SECTION 4: EFFECTIVE DATE 
 

This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after the date of its approval by the City 

Council of Daphne and publication as required by law. 

 

 ADOPTED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

DAPHNE THIS 15th DAY OF July 2019. 

 

 

 

 

              

        Dane Haygood, Mayor 

         

 

 

 

ATTEST: 

 

      

Candace G. Antinarella, City Clerk 

Page 15 of 105



Summary of changes to Fire Ordinance for 2024 

- Appendices:  Appendices are not enforceable unless they are adopted by the AHJ. 

 

- Creation of Agency: This section establishes the Authority of the Fire code official to 

enforce the code. And must be altered to have the Dept’s name in the code section. 

 

- Open Burning: Code numbers have changed 

 

- 105.7.1: This section is being moved to 901, which discusses submittal requirements for 

all fire protection systems.   The permit fees will remain the same for each permit, but 

have been removed from the ordinance. 

- 110.4: changing the code number to reflect the current reference in 2024, which is 113.4 

 

- 112.4: Same as above 

 

- 503.2.5: This is already covered in Appendix D 

 

- 505.1: We changed the requirement from 4” letters to 5.” (no change) 

 

- 506.1.1: This already says that the lock has to be approved by the Fire code official; there 

is no need to specify which type of lock. 

 

- 507.5.1.1: Added sprinkler verbiage so that a hydrant is within 100’ of any FDC  (No 

Change) 

 

- 508.5.7: This was added in the 2018 edition but was not necessary because it was already 

covered in NFPA 24.  Furthermore, this section or code # doesn’t exist in the 2024 IFC. 

 

- 901.2.1.1: This section adds all the previous information from 105 of the 2018 ordinance 

and places it in the correct area of the 2024 IFC. No information is changed, just 

relocated to flow better. 

 

- 903.4.4: This section was added so that, in the case of a multi-tenant building that only 

had a sprinkler monitoring system, all occupants would be notified if the sprinkler was 

activated. (DELETED; it is already covered in the 2024 edition) 

 

T(Appendices): Already stated in the beginning section but this includes the verbiage 

from changing the requirement of 2 entrances to recommended. 

 

Page 16 of 105



Sec. 12-31. - Definitions. 

 

 For the purpose of this division, the following terms, phrases, words, and their derivations 

shall have the meaning given herein. When not inconsistent with the context, the words used in 

the present tense include the future, words in the plural number include the singular number, and 

words in the singular number include the plural number. The word "shall" is always mandatory 

and not merely directive. 

… 

 Garbage receptacle. The term "garbage receptacle" shall mean a container that isprovided 

by the City of Daphne and commercially availableapproved for use as a garbage container, 

consisting of either which is (a) a not greater than thirty-fivesixty-four (3564) gallon capacity or 

less than thirty (30) gallon capacitysemi-automated receptacle, or (b) a ninety-six (96) gallon semi-

automated garbage cartreceptacle., as approved by the City of Daphne. The receptacle shall be free 

of jagged or sharp edges and shall be watertight and of impervious material, provided with a tight-

fitting cover suitable to protect the contents from flies, insects, rats, and other animals, and which 

shall not have any inside structures, such as inside bands or reinforcing angles or anything within 

that would prevent the free discharge of the contents. In no event shall metal drums be used as 

garbage receptacles. 

… 

 

Sec. 12-33. - Requirements for garbage removal. 

(a) Residential. All residents and occupants of residential units in Daphne, Alabama, shall be 

required to have accumulations of garbage removed and disposed of by: (1) the City of 

Daphne Solid Waste Department or a contractor to whom the City of Daphne has granted 

a franchise, (2) transporting to approved bulk containers or approved disposal sites, or (3) 

obtaining a permit from the health department to transport to a landfill. The City of Daphne 

will provide an initial ninety-six (96) gallon semi-automated or sixty-four (64) gallon semi-

automated garbage receptacle. 

(b) … 

(c) … 

(d) Placement. All garbage must be placed at the curbside within six (6) feet of the street before 

7:00 a.m. onno later than midnight preceding the scheduled collection day scheduled for 

pick up. No garbage shall be placed at the curbside more than twenty-four (24) hours prior 

to the day scheduled for pick up. If trash and garbage are scheduled for collection on the 

same day, materials should be neatly placed in separate areas of the curbside. Containers 

shall be removed from the curbside within twelve (12) hours after collection has occurred. 

Any garbage receptacle placed that does not follow these guidelines may not be collected. 

Please note that your collection time may vary from day to day.  

 

Sec. 12-34. - Preparation and receptacle requirements. 

(a) … 

(b) Location of receptacles; residential. Garbage receptacles shall be placed at ground level, 

within six (6) feet from the roadway on the property of the residential unit or commercial 

establishment which has accumulated the garbage, and shall not be kept upon city, county, 

or public property or neighboring property not in the ownership or tenancy of the person 

by whom the garbage is accumulated, whether such neighboring property be vacant or 

Page 17 of 105



improved except that it may be kept on the city right-of-way. In the case of multiple 

garbage receptacles, each garbage receptacle shall be placed at least four (4) feet from any 

other garbage receptacle. Such placement of garbage receptacles shall be easily accessible 

to the code enforcement officer for inspection and to employees of the contractor for 

collection. 

(1) Garbage shall be neatly placed so as to allow convenient passage of persons and 

vehicles on the roadway. At no time shall a receptacle or garbage be placed in a 

street, drainage ditch, storm drain, or gutter, nor should it be placed near trees, 

power lines, street signs, or near utility, cable, or telephone equipment. If garbage 

is placed near service equipment and damage occurs to said equipment due to 

collection efforts, the property owner shall be responsible for all necessary repairs 

or replacements. 

(2) Ownership of and responsibility for garbage material shall remain with the producer 

until collected. 

(c) Minimum receptacle specifications. 

(1) Receptacles required. All garbage must be placed in bags and the bags placed in 

garbage receptacles as defined herein. Such receptacles shall be in sufficient 

number to hold all garbage produced between regular collections. 

(2) Commercial receptacle exceptions. Garbage from commercial establishments may 

be stored or collected in a container designed for mechanical pickup provided that 

such container and the location of such container have been approved by the code 

enforcement officer. 

(3) Improper receptacles. Any container used for the collection or storage of garbage 

failing to meet the requirements of this section shall be clearly marked or identified 

by an agent of the contractor ora code enforcement officer, which marking or 

identification shall legibly specify in what manner the container fails to meet the 

requirements of garbage receptacles. Any container so tagged must be replaced 

with an acceptable container garbage receptacle within five (5) days after 

notification by the code enforcement officer. The contractor City will not be 

responsible for removing collecting garbage that is not properly prepared and 

placed in approved garbage receptacles. 

(d) … 

Page 18 of 105



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE NO.  2026-20 

 
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE CITY OF DAPHNE’S 

GARBAGE COLLECTION ORDINANCE NO. 2017-59, AS CODIFIED IN CHAPTER 
12, ARTICLE III, DAPHNE CODE OF ORDINANCES 

 WHEREAS, Ordinance 2017-59 established regulations governing the collection of 
garbage in the City of Daphne (the “City”), and those regulations are codified in Article III of 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, as previously amended; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the orderly and efficient collection of garbage is 
necessary to protect the public health, safety, and welfare of the residents of the City of Daphne; 
and 

 WHEREAS, the City desires to update its garbage collection regulations to reflect current 
solid waste collection practices, including the use of City-approved semi-automated receptacles 
and related placement requirements; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council further finds that clarification of the City’s garbage 
receptacle requirements, collection placement deadlines, and related operational rules will assist 
residents, City staff, and collection personnel in the consistent administration and enforcement of 
the Garbage Collection Ordinance; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council therefore finds it necessary and appropriate to amend 
Division 1, Article III, Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, commonly referred to as 
the City’s Garbage Collection Ordinance, to promote efficient garbage collection and continued 
protection of public health and safety. 

  NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA as follows:  

SECTION 1.   AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE 2017-59, SECTION II 
   (CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE III, DIVISION 1, SEC. 12-31) –   
   DEFINITIONS 

 Section I of Ordinance 2017-59, as codified at Section 12-31 of Division 1, Article III, 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, is hereby amended by repealing and replacing the 
definition of “Garbage receptacle” in its entirety with the following:  

 Garbage receptacle. The term “garbage receptacle” shall mean a container 
provided by the City of Daphne and approved for use as a garbage container, consisting of 
either (a) a sixty-four (64) gallon semi-automated receptacle, or (b) a ninety-six (96) gallon 
semi-automated receptacle. 

 

Page 19 of 105



2 
 

SECTION 2.   AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE 2017-59, SECTION III 
   (CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE III, DIVISION 1, SEC. 12-33) –   
   REQUIREMENTS FOR GARBAGE REMOVAL 

 Section III of Ordinance 2017-59, as codified at Section 12-33 of Division 1, Article III, 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, is hereby amended by repealing and replacing 
subsections (a) and (d) in their entirety with the following:  

(a) Residential. All residents and occupants of residential units in Daphne, Alabama, shall be 
required to have accumulations of garbage removed and disposed of by: (1) the City of 
Daphne Solid Waste Department or a contractor to whom the City of Daphne has granted 
a franchise, (2) transporting to approved bulk containers or approved disposal sites, or (3) 
obtaining a permit from the health department to transport to a landfill. The City of Daphne 
will provide an initial ninety-six (96) gallon semi-automated or sixty-four (64) gallon semi-
automated garbage receptacle. 

(b) … 
(c) … 
(d) Placement. All garbage must be placed at the curbside within six (6) feet of the street no 

later than midnight preceding the scheduled collection day. No garbage shall be placed at 
the curbside more than twenty-four (24) hours prior to the day scheduled for pick up. If 
trash and garbage are scheduled for collection on the same day, materials should be neatly 
placed in separate areas of the curbside. Containers shall be removed from the curbside 
within twelve (12) hours after collection has occurred. Any garbage receptacle placed that 
does not follow these guidelines may not be collected. Please note that your collection time 
may vary from day to day.  

 
SECTION 3.   AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE 2017-59, SECTION IV 
   (CHAPTER 12, ARTICLE III, DIVISION 1, SEC. 12-34) –   
   PREPARATION AND RECEPTACLE REQUIREMENTS 

 Section IV of Ordinance 2017-59, as codified at Section 12-34 of Division 1, Article III, 
Chapter 12 of the Daphne Code of Ordinances, is hereby amended by repealing and replacing 
subsections (b) and (c) in their entirety with the following:  

(a) … 
(b) Location of receptacles; residential. Garbage receptacles shall be placed at ground level, 

within six (6) feet from the roadway on the property of the residential unit or commercial 
establishment which has accumulated the garbage, and shall not be kept upon city, county, 
or public property or neighboring property not in the ownership or tenancy of the person 
by whom the garbage is accumulated, whether such neighboring property be vacant or 
improved except that it may be kept on the city right-of-way. In the case of multiple 
garbage receptacles, each garbage receptacle shall be placed at least four (4) feet from any 
other garbage receptacle. Such placement of garbage receptacles shall be easily accessible 
to the code enforcement officer for inspection and to employees of the contractor for 
collection. 
(1) Garbage shall be neatly placed so as to allow convenient passage of persons and 

vehicles on the roadway. At no time shall a receptacle or garbage be placed in a 
street, drainage ditch, storm drain, or gutter, nor should it be placed near trees, 
power lines, street signs, or near utility, cable, or telephone equipment. If garbage 

Page 20 of 105



3 
 

is placed near service equipment and damage occurs to said equipment due to 
collection efforts, the property owner shall be responsible for all necessary repairs 
or replacements. 

(2) Ownership of and responsibility for garbage material shall remain with the producer 
until collected. 

(c) Minimum receptacle specifications. 
(1) Receptacles required. All garbage must be placed in bags and the bags placed in 

garbage receptacles as defined herein. Such receptacles shall be in sufficient 
number to hold all garbage produced between regular collections.  

(2) Commercial receptacle exceptions. Garbage from commercial establishments may 
be stored or collected in a container designed for mechanical pickup provided that 
such container and the location of such container have been approved by the code 
enforcement officer. 

(3) Improper receptacles. Any container used for the collection or storage of garbage 
failing to meet the requirements of this section shall be clearly marked or identified 
by a code enforcement officer, which marking or identification shall legibly specify 
in what manner the container fails to meet the requirements of garbage receptacles. 
Any container so tagged must be replaced with an acceptable garbage receptacle 
within five (5) days after notification by the code enforcement officer. The City 
will not be responsible for collecting garbage that is not properly prepared and 
placed in approved garbage receptacles. 

(d) … 

SECTION 4.   SEVERABILITY 

 If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this ordinance is for any 
reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such portion shall 
be deemed a separate, distinct, and independent provision and such holding shall not affect the 
validity of the remaining portions hereof. 
 
SECTION 5.   SURVIVAL AND REPEALER 

 All other provisions of Ordinance 2017-59 not amended or repealed by this Ordinance 
remain in full effect. All other City Ordinances or parts thereof in conflict with the provisions of 
this Ordinance, in so far as they conflict, are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.   
 
SECTION 6.   EFFECTIVE DATE 

 This Ordinance shall be effective upon its due adoption by the City Council and publication 
as required by law.   
 

 ADOPTED AND APPROVED on this ____ day of ___________, 2026.  

 
                                                             __________________________________ 
       Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk  

Page 21 of 105



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE 2026-19 

 
AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING A TEMPORARY MORATORIUM ON THE 

ACCEPTANCE AND PROCESSING OF CERTAIN APPLICATIONS FOR MULTI-
FAMILY RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT PENDING COMPREHENSIVE 

REVISIONS TO THE CITY’S LAND USE AND DEVELOPMENT ORDINANCE 
 

 WHEREAS, the City of Daphne is currently engaged in a comprehensive review and 
overhaul of its Land Use and Development Ordinance (“LUDO”), including provisions relating to 
zoning classifications, development standards, density, infrastructure impacts, stormwater 
management, and compatibility of land uses; 

 WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that the existing provisions of the LUDO 
applicable to multi-family residential development may require substantial revision as part of that 
ongoing process; 

 WHEREAS, the City Council finds that the acceptance and processing of new applications 
for multi-family residential developments during the pendency of the LUDO overhaul could result 
in projects being reviewed under standards that are likely to be materially revised in the near future; 

 WHEREAS, the City Council further finds that a temporary moratorium of limited 
duration and scope is necessary to allow the City sufficient time to complete and consider such 
revisions in an orderly manner and to protect the public health, safety, and general welfare; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council finds that this temporary moratorium is a reasonable and 
narrowly tailored measure intended to preserve the status quo while the City completes its ongoing 
planning and ordinance revision efforts. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF DAPHNE, as follows: 
 

1. Temporary Moratorium. Effective immediately upon adoption of this Ordinance, 
the City shall not accept, process, or approve any application for rezoning, pre-zoning, site plan 
approval, master plan approval, planned development approval, or other development approval for 
any new multi-family residential development within the corporate limits of the City of Daphne. 
For purposes of this Ordinance, “multi-family residential development” shall include apartments, 
townhomes, condominiums, duplexes, and similar residential developments containing more than 
one dwelling unit on a single lot or unified development site. 

2. Exemptions. This moratorium shall not apply to:  

 (a) applications determined by the City to be complete and accepted for review 
prior to the effective date of this Ordinance; 

 (b) applications currently pending before the Planning Commission or City Council 
as of the effective date of this Ordinance; or 

 (c) developments for which final site plan approval has already been granted prior 
to the effective date of this Ordinance. 

Page 22 of 105



2 
 

3. Effective Period. The moratorium shall be effective immediately upon adoption 
and publication as required by law and shall remain in effect for a period of one hundred eighty 
(180) days unless sooner terminated or extended by action of the City Council.  

4. Severability. Should any provision of this Ordinance, or its application to any 
person or circumstance, be declared unconstitutional or otherwise invalid for any reason, or should 
any provision of this Ordinance be pre-empted by State of Federal law or regulation, such decision 
of pre-emption shall not affect the validity of the remaining provisions of this Ordinance or its 
application to other persons or circumstances.  
 

ADOPTED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
DAPHNE, ALABAMA, ON THIS THE ____ DAY OF __________, 2026.  
 
    
       ________________________________ 
       Robin LeJeune, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
_______________________________________ 
Cindy Beaudreau, City Clerk 
 

Page 23 of 105



Page 24 of 105



Page 25 of 105



Page 26 of 105



Page 27 of 105



Page 28 of 105



Page 29 of 105



Page 30 of 105



Page 31 of 105



Page 32 of 105



Page 33 of 105



Page 34 of 105



Page 35 of 105



Page 36 of 105



Page 37 of 105



Page 38 of 105



Page 39 of 105



Page 40 of 105



Page 41 of 105



Page 42 of 105



Page 43 of 105



Page 44 of 105



Page 45 of 105



Page 46 of 105



Page 47 of 105



Page 48 of 105



Page 49 of 105



Page 50 of 105



Page 51 of 105



Page 52 of 105



Page 53 of 105



Page 54 of 105



Page 55 of 105



Page 56 of 105



Page 57 of 105



Page 58 of 105



Page 59 of 105



Page 60 of 105



Page 61 of 105



Page 62 of 105



Page 63 of 105



Page 64 of 105



Page 65 of 105



Page 66 of 105



Page 67 of 105



Page 68 of 105



Page 69 of 105



Page 70 of 105



Page 71 of 105



Page 72 of 105



Page 73 of 105



Page 74 of 105



Page 75 of 105



Page 76 of 105



Page 77 of 105



Page 78 of 105



Page 79 of 105



Page 80 of 105



Page 81 of 105



Page 82 of 105



Page 83 of 105



Page 84 of 105



Page 85 of 105



Page 86 of 105



Page 87 of 105



Page 88 of 105



Page 89 of 105



Page 90 of 105



Page 91 of 105



Page 92 of 105



Page 93 of 105



Page 94 of 105



Page 95 of 105



Page 96 of 105



Page 97 of 105



Page 98 of 105



Page 99 of 105



Page 100 of 105



Page 101 of 105



Page 102 of 105



Page 103 of 105



CITY OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA 
ORDINANCE 2022-70 

AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE NO. 2004-11 (BUSINESS LICENSE ORDINANCE) 
TO MODERNIZE CERTAIN REQUIREMENTS RELATING TO 

LICENSE TERM AND MINIMUM AMOUNT 

WHEREAS, the City of Daphne, after due consideration, believes that certain revisions to 
the City of Daphne's Business License Ordinance are necessary to modernize certain requirements 
relating to the license term and minimum amount for any business license. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF DAPHNE, ALABAMA, as follows: 

SECTION 1. AMENDMENT TO ORDINANCE 2004-11 - LICENSE TERM AND 
MINIMUMS 

Section 13-253 ofChapter 13, Article XII ofthe Code of Ordinances ofthe City ofDaphne, 
Alabama is hereby amended by repealing subsections (b) and (c) in their entirety and replacing 
them with the following: 

(b) Half year. In case the license of any business, trade, occupation or profession is 
based on a flat rate and is taken out after July I, only one-half (Yz) of the license 
shall be charged and collected, except for those whose gross receipts are in excess 
of $100,000. 

(c) Issue fee. For each license issued there shall be an issue fee collected in an amount 
equal to the maximum amount allowable by the Department of Revenue, which 
shall be adjusted every five (5) license years by an amount equal to the percentage 
increase in the U.S. Department of Labor's Producer Price Index, with the base year 
being 2006. The said issue fee shall be collected in the same manner as the license 
fee. 

SECTION 2. CONFLICT WITH OTHER ORDINANCES 

Any Ordinance heretofore adopted by the City Council of Daphne, Alabama, which is in 
conflict with this Ordinance, is hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict. 

SECTION 3. SEVERABILITY 

The provisions of this Ordinance are severable. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, 
phrase, or portion of this Ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court 
of competent jurisdiction such portion shall be deemed a separate, distinct and independent 
provision and such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions hereof. 

Page 104 of 105



SECTION 4. EFFECTIVE DATE 

This Ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after the date of its approval by 
the City Council of the City of Daphne and publication as required by law, with an effective date 
of January 1, 2023. 

ADOPTED AND APPROVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
DAPHNE, ALABAMA, THIS 3rd DAY OF January, 2023. 

ATTEST: 

2 

Page 105 of 105




